

EXHIBIT A

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States



ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice #	0000062
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$235,101.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Coleman re GMRS case -- facts, case history, where the case is at and where it's headed	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S. Coleman re: Walsh v. GMRS (factual background, procedural history, and status of case)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research regarding individual liability (i.e. principals of a company) under the TCPA.	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re research findings about individual liability under TCPA and discuss Tony Diana's (GMRS owner) potential liability	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Online research into GMRS owner Diana -- finding other political polling companies apparently run by him. Are these companies related to the calls being made in this case?	330.00	2.8	924.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Review Case MGMT Orders entered in GMRS case	330.00	0.9	297.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Factual research into Diana's other entities	330.00	1.4	462.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Complaint (dkt. 1) file in Walsh v. Anthony Diana and Global Marketing Research Services	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research: review legality of political calls to cell phones under TCPA and FCC regs (1.8); research liability of individuals under TCPA (1.4)	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Review GMRS's initial disclosures	330.00	1.4	462.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS insurance policy	330.00	3.8	1,254.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Research regarding any court cases analyzing GMRS' old dominion policy or similar policy language	330.00	2.4	792.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re GMRS initial disclosures	330.00	0.9	297.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Coleman S Woodrow regarding GMRS discovery	330.00	0.7	231.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze case docket: review entries to date (1.8); review and analyze Diana's and GMRS's Motions to dismiss and strike (dkt. 16-17), stip to dismiss Diana (dkt. 18), Response to Motion to Dismiss Complaint (dkt 19); and Case Management Orders (2.8)	430.00	4.6	1,978.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS's initial disclosures (128 pages), including single Old Dominion insurance policy and review of extensive witness list	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding GMRS' naming of congressional reps who helped draft TCPA in their initial disclosures	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research looking for any precedent to naming members of Congress as witnesses in TCPA case	330.00	5.3	1,749.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/15] Steven Woodrow: conference with S. Coleman re: status of discovery	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: ability to name members of Congress and FCC as witnesses in TCPA litigation to testify re: intent of statute (in resp. to GMRS listing of such witnesses in 26(a)(1) disclosure)	430.00	1.9	817.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Further research regarding GMRS' insurance policy -- in particular advertising injury insurance coverage opinions	330.00	4.7	1,551.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Review edit and proof S Woodrow draft letter to GMRS regarding faulty initial disclosures	330.00	2.2	726.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and Analyze Court's Order denying Motion to Dismiss (dkt. 30)	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S. Coleman re: coverage under insurance policy and the need for any additional insurance policies	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: insurance coverage under 11th Cir. law for "advertising injury"	430.00	3.3	1,419.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
	and TCPA claims (2.2); review insurance coverage exclusions (1.1)			
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft letter to GMRS counsel re: deficiencies in 26(a)(1) disclosures and proposal for face-to-face meeting	430.00	3.1	1,333.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S. Coleman re: face to face meeting proposal to GMRS	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails with S Schwartz re initial disclosures	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Coleman S Woodrow re GMRS case	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email and letter to S.Schwartz re: initial disclosures	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S. Coleman re: client, Melanie Walsh	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/14/15] Patrick Peluso: participate in conference with Woodrow and Coleman re GMRS discovery and upcoming deadlines in the case	330.00	0.6	198.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S. Coleman re: discovery and case deadlines	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Review the Damasco pick off issues in 11th Cir -- find Stein v Bucs and read and analyze that case	330.00	2.5	825.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/19/15] Patrick Peluso: conference with S Woodrow re class named P pick offs in 11th, and state of law generally	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: pick offs and need for placeholder motion in 11th Cir. (review Stein v. Tampa Bay Buccaneers)	430.00	0.8	344.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS answers and affirmative defenses -- notice a constitutionality defense	330.00	2.4	792.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re GMRS affirmative defenses	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Extensive legal research regarding GMRS' constitutionality defense -- including searching for cases finding TCPA unconstitutional (5.5) and how D's can challenge a statute more generally (2)	330.00	7.5	2,475.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS ans. and affirmative defenses	430.00	1.4	602.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: constitutionality of TCPA	430.00	1.7	731.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research regarding TCPA as applied to GMRS case -- what is the consent requirement for political calls? Is there some sort of political exception?	330.00	4.7	1,551.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Woodrow S Coleman re GMRS -- insurance and their defenses were discussed	330.00	0.6	198.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Further legal research into consent under the TCPA--attempting to answer question of whether GMRS can lift numbers off voter logs and call that prior consent	330.00	3.3	1,089.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Further legal research re: GMRS affirmative defenses: constitutionality of TCPA (1.4); requirements of prior express consent for political calls (2.1)	430.00	3.5	1,505.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: answer and affirmative defenses (.4) and further conf. re: insurance coverage (.2)	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow regarding potential motion to strike aff defenses	330.00	0.7	231.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS renewed motion to strike	330.00	2	660.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Research ability to file motion to strike affirmative defenses and efficacy of doing so in 11th Circuit	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Further legal research re: use of voter ID registrations as prior express consent under TCPA	430.00	1.6	688.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS motion to strike	330.00	1.9	627.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, proof, and amend S Woodrow's draft opp to GMRS Motion to Strike	330.00	5.4	1,782.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS Motion to Strike allegations and claims prior args were "overlooked"	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Steven Woodrow: conf w/ S.Coleman re: GMRS motion to strike and affect on insurance coverage	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Steven Woodrow: research re: affect of allegations in complaint on avail. of insurance coverage (willful and knowing and dissemination/publication of information)	430.00	3.4	1,462.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Research caselaw re: motions to strike and motions to reconsider (1.4); Draft and edit proposed response in opposition to GMRS Motion to Strike (2.7)	430.00	4.1	1,763.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Review Court's order denying MTS	330.00	0.8	264.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Court's order denying GMRS motion to strike	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails regarding the mediator issue	330.00	1.1	363.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS responses to Plaintiff's Interrogatories	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S. Coleman re: discovery responses	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS filing re: notice of mediation naming T.White as mediator (.2); review emails re: agreement to use R.Max (.4); draft email to S.Schwartz (.1); conference w/ S.Coleman re: switching of mediators (.8)	430.00	1.5	645.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS' responses to Interrogatories	330.00	3.8	1,254.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow s Coleman re discovery letter to GMRS	330.00	0.6	198.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise 7 page discovery letter re: interrogatories	430.00	4.3	1,849.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ PPeluso and S.Coleman re: discovery letter to GMRS	430.00	0.6	258.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, analyze, and amend S Woodrow's discovery letter	330.00	3.9	1,287.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow S Coleman re clients retained in other states -- could add as P's	330.00	0.6	198.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Review case docs and filings from Shamblin v. Obama for America TCPA litigation re: liability for autodialed survey calls (2.6); review case filings and decisions from De Los Santos v. Millward Brown (.8)	430.00	3.4	1,462.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: potential clients in other states	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email exchange w/ private insurance lawyer re: GMRS's policies	430.00	0.8	344.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit discovery letter re: interrogatories	430.00	0.3	129.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Produced docs in response to RTP	330.00	6.7	2,211.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding a case against Obama for America where Obama was challenged for survey calls	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Shamblin v Obama for America case -- including analyzing all important filings	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS responses to Plaintiff's First Set of Requests to Produce Documents (call training manuals, insurance docs, other call documents)	430.00	2.6	1,118.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: discovery email to S.Schwartz (.4); conf. re: clients in additional states (.7)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise discovery dispute letter to S.Schwartz (counsel for GMRS) re: issues re: GMRS's responses to 36 requests for production.	430.00	4.4	1,892.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Research GMRS privilege objections and privilege log	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email sent by S.Coleman	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re FCC order re political calls	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow S Coleman re clients	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching FCC Orders post-conference with Woodrow	330.00	1.4	462.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Research and review FCC notice issued 9.11.12 re: autodialed political survey calls to cellphone numbers	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: discovery conference and client issues	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional research regarding liability for autodialed cell calls -- and whether the political issue GMRS continues to raise really matters	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing FCC advisory opinions on the meaning of prior express consent	330.00	1.5	495.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/09/15] Steven Woodrow: further research re: use of autodialers to call cellphones for political purposes and liability under TCPA and regs	430.00	1.8	774.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Communication w/ Stefan Coleman re: discovery and settlement and insurance	430.00	1.1	473.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS's discovery responses and Plaintiff's discovery letters in prep. for discovery meet and confer w/ GMRS counsel next day	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in meet and confer with S Schwartz	330.00	1	330.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re upcoming meet and confer	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow and Coleman regarding meet and confer	330.00	0.4	132.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Discovery meet and confer w/ opposing counsel	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: lengthy discovery meet and confer w/ S.Schwartz	430.00	0.4	172.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review of documents and discovery correspondence in preparation for meet and confer	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Draft letter to GMRS re settlement proposal	330.00	2.9	957.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 02/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS insurance policies for 2012-2014	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding GMRS' insurance policies	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference call w S Coleman	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Further revisions to GMRS discovery letter -- after Woodrow edits	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: GMRS	430.00	0.3	129.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise discovery letter to S.Schwartz (counsel for GMRS) as follow up to 2.12.15 discussion at end of meet and confer	430.00	1.6	688.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Final editing of settlement letter	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference w Coleman regarding our settlement letter	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: settlement letter	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email to S.Schwartz from S.Coleman	430.00	0.1	43.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy session with S Woodrow regarding settling GMRS case	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: settlement strategy	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Review GMRS' response to our settlement ltr	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re response to settlement letter	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow regarding ability of our rep to be a proper named plaintiff in terms of out-of-state surveys	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, analyze, and revise S Woodrow's draft response to Schwartz regarding his proposed limits on the class	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Research into whether GMRS has any support for the notion that this class must be limited to only surveys conducted in named P's state	330.00	6.4	2,112.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS's response to settlement letter of 2.18	430.00	1.6	688.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Research ability of class representative to represent out of state consumers (in response to GMRS demand that case be limited to survey involving Walsh)	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference w S Coleman re response to Schwartz	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft response settlement email to Steven Schwartz re: class relief and individual relief and addressing GMRS questions and limitations on class	430.00	3.6	1,548.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: email response to S.Schwartz	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Research M.D. Fla class settlements, and judge's history with them.	330.00	4.8	1,584.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Initial research into MD Fla fees and incentive awards	330.00	1.3	429.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review and analysis of Shamblin v. Obama for America case documents and analyze impact on GMRS litigation	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Reviewed history of Judge Presnell approving class action settlements (including Ault v. Walt Disney, Poertner v. Gillette) (1.8); research court's history with TCPA cases (Wagner v. CLC etc.) (1.6)	430.00	3.4	1,462.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow re mediation	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: potential for mediation and settlement framework	430.00	0.5	215.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: recent TCPA settlements in prep for potential mediation in GMRS	430.00	2.2	946.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: following up w. GMRS re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ Stefan re: discovery and strategizing re: settlement call w/ S.Schwartz	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference call with S. Schwartz	330.00	0.9	297.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 03/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS discovery responses	430.00	1.7	731.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w. GMRS re: settlement and mediation	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferences w S Coleman re mediation and clients in other states (and how that impacts mediation strategy)	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exchanges between S Woodrow and GMRS regarding insurance, admins	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding his feedback from settlement admins	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into the viability of filing separate cases with new plaintiffs -- will they get MDL'd? Would they be consolidated? Can we define the classes to exclude all other states?	330.00	7.4	2,442.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: clients in other states	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz, counsel for GMRS, re: claims administrators, settlement insurance, and other states where Plaintiffs have clients in addition to Walsh	430.00	1.7	731.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Communications with 4 separate settlement administrators re: submission of bids for GMRS settlement	430.00	1.8	774.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Research ability to file state-only class actions; first to file rule, motions to transfer	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Research TCPA class actions against members of Congress (.9); research Rule 26(a)(1) obligations and motions to compel/strike related to initial disclosures (2.6)	430.00	3.5	1,505.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S.Coleman re: client	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: ability to file separate class actions: research likelihood of MDL consisting of 3 or fewer cases (review MDL denials of transfer for 3 cases and under)	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re GMRS' insurance policy	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy session with S Woodrow re filing of other cases	330.00	1	330.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Old Dominion insurance policies	430.00	1.4	602.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: TCPA coverage exclusions	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re idea of using claims insurance as a creative way to settle the matter	330.00	1	330.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Research use of claims insurance in class action settlements	430.00	2.2	946.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 03/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS discovery re: info re: how to compile class list and calculate projected number of class members	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Follow up communications w/ settlement admins re: projections of costs	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference call re claims insurance	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ J.Fineberg re: claims insurance (.4); research caselaw to determine potential application in GMRS (.8)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S COleman S Woodrow re mediation	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: availability of claims insurance for GMRS case	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ Stefan re: mediation location and strategy	430.00	0.4	172.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and send follow up email to S.Schwartz re: mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Review docket and recent correspondence in preparation for call w/ S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze email from S Coleman regarding a recent settlement- Milward Brown	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Milward Brown settlement	330.00	2.6	858.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re Millward Brown	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman (1.0) and email exchange w/ office for counsel for Defendant (.2) re: mediator selection and dates	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Millward Brown settlement (\$11 million fund, claims process)- review all settlement documents in preparation for mediation of GMRS (2.8)	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails with mediator Max and S Schwartz	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: agreement to mediate w/ R. Max	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Review prior express consent defense re: claim of consent based on voter registration	430.00	0.9	387.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in strategy session regarding mediation -- what's the goal? How do we get there? What is our strategy in different scenarios?	330.00	1.6	528.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 03/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy session for mediation: contingent plan if mediation is unsuccessful, prep roadmap for litigation	430.00	1.6	688.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research: research caselaw re: direct provision of phone number vs. use of intermediary (2.2); further research re: updates to FCC regs (1.2)	430.00	3.4	1,462.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference call with Walsh re mediation	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ client re: mediation	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 03/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Review caselaw re: constitutionality of TCPA	430.00	2.7	1,161.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze various emails between Woodrow and Schwartz	330.00	1.1	363.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call w R Max regarding this Terry White issue	330.00	0.8	264.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS' filed notice of mediation	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow about what to do about GMRS filing about the wrong mediator	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching how to file pro hac app in MD Fla	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting pro hac app for S Woodrow P Peluso	330.00	1.8	594.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Coleman re pro hac app	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Research into Mediator Terry White's class experience	330.00	1.8	594.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: mediators (1.4), call w. R.Max re: Schwartz emails and court filing re: T.White (.8)	430.00	2.2	946.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review pro hac vice application	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S. Coleman re: attempt by GMRS counsel to switch agreed-upon mediator	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial drafting of mediation statement: prepare outline of facts and argument for mediation brief (1.6); draft liability section and sections re: comparable cases and settlements (2.8)	430.00	4.2	1,806.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review local rules and rules of professional conduct re: breaching agreement and filing documents without agreement of other side (in response to GMRS filing notice of mediation naming mediator parties did not agree to)	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails exchanged about switching mediation to be with Rodney Max	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Coleman S Woodrow about mediation	330.00	1.1	363.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing revised notice of mediation filed by GMRS	330.00	0.2	66.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy session with S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	1.1	473.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting of mediation statement: research FL law re: insurance agreement and coverage of advertising injury and invasions of privacy (2.3); draft factual background (1.8)	430.00	4.1	1,763.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchanges re-setting mediation to occur w/ R. Max	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: "called party" in 11th circuit (Osario)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Compiling spreadsheet of 25 TCPA cases -- money paid, fees, how notice was conducted, etc.	330.00	8.3	2,739.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising of mediation statement to R.Max: edit argument sections (3.2); revise sec. re: merits and class cert (1.2); revise sec. re: proposal for settlement (2.3); revise arg. re: lack of defenses (1.7)	430.00	7.4	3,182.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R.Max office re: mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ R.Max re: exchange of mediation briefs	430.00	0.2	86.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Review docket, discovery, and motions in preparation for continued drafting of mediation statement	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Research and review 25 TCPA class action settlements (17 calls, 8 text messages) for relief offered, per claim amounts, total fund amounts, type of notice, and fees and costs	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/15] Patrick Peluso: review, edit, proof, and amend mediation statement	330.00	5.7	1,881.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow S Coleman	330.00	0.8	264.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S.Coleman re: mediation strategy and client	430.00	0.8	344.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Further revisions to and editing of draft mediation statement: revise facts (1.3); add arg. re: availability of other plaintiffs (1.6); revise introduction (.4); revise section outlining settlement models (1.7); prep section re: information and clarifications needed (1.4); review for spelling and cites (.5)	430.00	6.9	2,967.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Discussion with S Woodrow about GMRS mediation brief	330.00	0.2	66.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: mediation brief	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mediation brief	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize PHV motion	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order denying w/o prejudice pro hac app	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing local rule judge said we didn't comply with in pro hac app	330.00	0.7	231.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Patrick Peluso: revising pro hac apps to be in compliance with local rules	330.00	0.8	264.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Coleman re revised pro hac vice applications	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Review S Woodrow's latest edits to mediation brief, and further proofing	330.00	1.2	396.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: political survey class actions and settlements	430.00	2.2	946.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revisions to mediation statement for proper tone, grammar, spelling etc.	430.00	1.8	774.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Review order denying PHV motion and conf. w/ P.Peluso and S.Coleman re: new motion	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: confidentiality of mediation statement	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference re claims insurance	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference w mediator Max	330.00	0.75	247.50
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding a TCPA case he discovered - Mankins	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Mankins	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. with J.Finestein re: claims insurance	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ R. Max re: settlement	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze TCPA settlements for non-solicitation calls	430.00	2.7	1,161.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze TCPA survey call case Mankin v. Mountain West Research Center	430.00	2.1	903.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 04/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing notice of phv fees paid - Woodrow and Peluso	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Research opposing counsel's history with class actions and complex litigation on PACER and Westlaw (Kensington Management, Tatis v. US Bancorp, National Presto, Solar Cosmetics)	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy meeting with S Woodrow about upcoming mediation	330.00	2	660.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy session w/ P.Peluso in advance of mediation: review possible settlement frameworks (2); review and analyze discovery responses and discovery correspondence (.8)	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Woodrow S Coleman re settlement approach	330.00	1.3	429.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Stefan re: settlement strategy	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Call with mediator	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ R. Max re: upcoming mediation	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.6	258.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Travel to Mediation	330.00	6.5	2,145.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Mediation prep	330.00	5.8	1,914.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy discussions with S Woodrow regarding GMRS mediation	330.00	3	990.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Travel to Ft. Lauderdale for mediation	430.00	6.5	2,795.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Prepare for mediation: review mediation statement and pleadings (1.2); review TCPA case law and regs (.9), review TCPA settlements re: surveys (1.3); review insurance agreement documents (1.4)	430.00	4.8	2,064.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ M. Walsh re: mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Mediation	330.00	7	2,310.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Travel back from mediation	330.00	7.5	2,475.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing mediation with S Woodrow	330.00	1.5	495.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Mediation in Boca Raton, FL at defense counsel office	430.00	7	3,010.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Travel back to Denver CO following mediation	430.00	7	3,010.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Review settlement term sheet, edit and revise it	330.00	1.9	627.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Coleman re mediation	330.00	0.7	231.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise draft settlement term sheet	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Review mediation notes	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with R Max re mediation	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max re: mediation	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S.Coleman re: insurance in GMRS and prospects for settlement insurance	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R. Max re: status of settlement and term sheet	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Steven Woodrow -- discussed term sheet	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with claims insurance guy	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ J.Fineberg	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: mediation term sheet and issues	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 04/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Review settlement terms, discovery responses and information from mediation in prep. for call w/ J.Fineberg	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference R Max status of settlement discussions	330.00	0.2	66.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ R.Max re: settlement status	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of term sheet	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: settlement status (.4); email exchange re: Obama for America order denying class certification (.8)	430.00	1.2	516.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ M.Walsh re: settlement and mediation	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze email from S Woodrow to S Coleman regarding Obama for America case	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Patrick Peluso: additional revisions to term sheet	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze denial of class cert in the Obama case	330.00	2.3	759.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with R Max	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to S.Coleman re: Obama political calling case	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Obama for America political calling case denial of class certification and analyze impact on GMRS political calls	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R. Max re: settlement framework	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/04/15] Patrick Peluso: conference w R Max	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ mediator re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with R Max -- discussed insurance issues	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Discussion w S Woodrow regarding his research into viability of claims insurance	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Mediator re: insurance	430.00	0.3	129.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research of availability of claims insurance products	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Coleman regarding status of settlement talks	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: settlement	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: settlement	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Mediator re: settlement status	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding whether we should terminate talks	330.00	0.2	66.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: settlement and termination of negotiations	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Coleman - discussed whether we should just tell GMRS we're litigating	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Colman re: return to litigation/termination of mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Mediator Max	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing our case schedule, looking at local rules, and devising plan for returning to litigate the case since mediation was unproductive	330.00	3.2	1,056.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 05/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review docket in preparation for returning to litigation and adjournment of mediation (.8); review status of discovery (responses and communications) (1.0)	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow about strategy moving forward	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w. PPeluso re: return to litigation and strategy	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: litigation strategy	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ mediator re: returning to litigation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Discussion with Woodrow about whether this Campbell Ewald cert petition impacts our case	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/19/15] Steven Woodrow: review and analyze Gomez petition for certiorari and impact on filing additional cases in GMRS	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding amending complaint and filing motions to compel	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R.Max re: adjournment of mediation	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: motion for leave to file amended complaint and discovery motions	430.00	0.3	129.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing local rules on moving to compel (1) and researching other motions decided by Judge Presnell (2.5)	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exchange w Woodrow and Schwartz	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Review MD FL local rules re: discovery motions and applicable standing orders re: filing of discovery motions	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: resuming litigation and meeting and conferring re discovery	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Discussion with Woodrow and Coleman regarding amending	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: amending pleadings in Walsh case	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with Woodrow and Coleman about filing other complaints	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferences with Nicole Zilveti and Alicia Thompson (CA and PA potential class reps)	330.00	0.8	264.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze mediation report	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Further conf. w/ S.Coleman re: ability to file in other states	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy talk with Steve Woodrow	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Compiling mediation costs	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Calls w/ new proposed reps in FL and CA	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: GMRS litigation	430.00	0.4	172.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Review mediation expenses	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow regarding what discovery we need	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and editing Steve's discovery outline	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with named P Walsh	330.00	0.3	99.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with potential named P Armstrong	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding Gomez's potential impact	330.00	1	330.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Steven Woodrow: outline discovery needed	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Walsh	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ K. Armstrong	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with potential named P Martin	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze briefing in petition for certiorari in Gomez re: warding against pick offs (1.3); analyze application for additional GMRS cases (1.8)	430.00	3.1	1,333.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Martin re: joining lawsuit	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman and reviewed/vetted potential plaintiffs in FL, NH, NC, TX, VA, PA, MA, NY, TN and NE.	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into class environment (how often classes are certified/dismissed, etc.) in the states where Coleman has potential plaintiffs, including Nebraska, New Hampshire, Texas, Virginia, Mass., New York, and Tennessee	330.00	5.8	1,914.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman S Woodrow regarding new clients	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Further conf. w/ S.Coleman re: additional clients	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting amended complaint	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze draft FAC in Martin v. GMRS	430.00	2.3	989.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review docket and CMC order setting case schedule	430.00	0.6	258.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order to show cause	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re order to show cause	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman re ECF registration	330.00	0.3	99.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
General	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Registering for ECF	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting response ot order to show cause	330.00	1.6	528.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revise draft Martin and Armstrong complaint v. GMRS	430.00	2.1	903.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Order to Show Cause re: ECF registration	430.00	0.7	301.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft opposition to order to show cause	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails to Schwartz regarding discovery, terminating mediation	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: termination of mediation, discovery needed, and amending complaint	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails to S Scwhartz	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting initial motion class cert	330.00	3.3	1,089.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research motion for class cert -- 11th circuit standard on Rule 23 requirements	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Further email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: discovery, amendments etc.	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: motion for leave: review cases allowing for substitution of named plaintiffs and relation back of claims (2.2), modification of class definitions (1.3) pleading of john doe defs (2.4); local rules re: meet and confer (.4)	430.00	6.3	2,709.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: amending Walsh v. GMRS to include Martin and Armstrong	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Further revision to FAC	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Further review and edits motion for class cert	330.00	3.8	1,254.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and edit motion for leave to file FAC (8.9)(draft factual background/ procedural history (3.2), introduction (.9), argument section (1.8) explanation of amendments (2.6), editing for style and tone (.6)); Revise placeholder motion for class cert (1.3); further revisions to draft FAC (1.4)	430.00	11.6	4,988.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Edit Woodrow decl	330.00	1.1	363.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, analyze, and further amend motion for leave to file FAC	330.00	5.6	1,848.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re exhibits to motion for leave	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Compiling exhibits motion for leave	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Finalizing motion for class cert	330.00	1.6	528.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Woodrow Declaration in Support of Motion for Leave to File FAC	430.00	1.2	516.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revising of Motion for Leave to File FAC: edit section re: John Doe defendants (1.8); revise arg. re: class definition and carve out of state-only classes (1.3); edit fact section (.8); revise introduction (.7); edit arg. re: relation back of claims and similarity of claims (1.1)	430.00	5.7	2,451.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: exhibits for Motion for Leave	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: finalization of motion for leave and supporting documents	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Final review of Motion for Leave, Amended Complaint, and draft placeholder class certification motion prior to filing	430.00	1.1	473.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft initial outline of Motion to Compel discovery responses: review and analyze all discovery communications, discovery responses, privilege log, and other discovery documents (2.2); draft outline of brief argument (1.1)	430.00	3.3	1,419.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, analyze, proof, and amend motion to compel discovery responses drafted by S Woodrow	330.00	7.5	2,475.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Editing and drafting of Motion to Compel Discovery Responses against GMRS: draft intro (.6); draft procedural history (1.1); draft arg. section re: objection to producing out of state information (2.2); draft arg. section re: identifying agents who made the calls and obtained consent (2.7); revise brief (.8)	430.00	6.8	2,924.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w S Woodrow re prep of Motion to Compel	330.00	0.3	99.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: service of GMRS complaint and preparation of Motion to Compel	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: caselaw (Toney v. Quality Resources, Shamblin v. Obama) and FCC decisions (ie., Dish Network) re: agency liability under the TCPA	430.00	2.3	989.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Follow up research to S Woodrow's research regarding ratification	330.00	2.5	825.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference s Woodrow re ratification argument	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Further prep of Motion to Compel	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review of caselaw re: allegations of agency and ratification	430.00	1.3	559.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 06/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review of discovery responses and GMRS privilege log and editing of motion to compel	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Coleman re motion to compel	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: filing of motion to compel	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow S Coleman about new cases	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: filing of additional cases	430.00	0.2	86.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 06/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revisions to draft Motion to Compel against GMRS re: discovery responses	430.00	2.4	1,032.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow about what happens when Class Rep Says can't serve as named P	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Follow up research to S Woodrow's initial research to substituting class named P	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: substitution of class representatives when class rep can no longer serve	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial draft of discovery letter to S.Schwartz re: outstanding issues and requesting meet and confer	430.00	2.1	903.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Editing S Woodrow's discovery letter to Schwartz	330.00	1.5	495.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: evidence needed through discovery that remains outstanding, edits to motion to compel	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising of discovery letter to S.Schwartz: revise sec. re: substitution of plaintiffs (1.6), need for amending Rule 26(a)(1) disclosures (.7), GMRS's need to ID third party clients who provided consent and on whose behalves calls were made, identification of ATDS, identification of other call campaigns (2.4); finalize letter for tone, grammar, spelling, etc. (.5)	430.00	5.2	2,236.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional edits to GMRS discovery letter	330.00	4.8	1,584.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research regarding GMRS's refusal to id 3rd party clietns who may have liability	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 06/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Final revisions to discovery letter prior to S.Coleman emailing doc to Opposing Counsel (S.Schwartz)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Review court's order granting leave to file FAC	330.00	0.8	264.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court's order granting leave to file Amended Complaint	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Review local rules re: failing to timely file responsive brief (14 days)	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ mediator re: progress of litigation	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with R Max re mediating a 2nd time	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Follow up conf. w/ R.Max re: status of litigation and projected return to mediation	430.00	0.2	86.00

Total	235,101.50
--------------	-------------------

Amount Paid	0.00
-------------	------

Balance Due (USD)	\$235,101.50
--------------------------	---------------------

PAYMENT STUB

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
3900 E Mexico Ave
Suite 300
Denver CO
United States

Client	ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com
Invoice #	0000062
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$235,101.50
Amount Enclosed	

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States



ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice #	0000063
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$278,419.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Prep FAC for filing	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference w Martin - FL new named P	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Martin	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Nicole Zilveti regarding CA case	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Zilveti	430.00	0.3	129.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revising of Motion to Compel discovery responses against GMRS	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails with GMRS attorney Schwartz about depositions	330.00	0.7	231.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional edits to motion to compel discovery responses	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Send initial email S. Schwartz, review and analyze email from S.Schwartz regarding depositions (scheduling, location, scope, objections) (1.2)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 07/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review of list of outstanding discovery for Motion to Compel	430.00	0.6	258.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Motion to Compel	430.00	2.2	946.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re Civitas Instt.	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Factual research into Civitas institute	330.00	2.5	825.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Further revisions and editing of Motion to Compel	430.00	1.8	774.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 07/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Research "Civitas Institute" (listed on Rule 26(a)(1) disclosures) re: potential subpoena in GMRS	430.00	1.2	516.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Further edits and revisions to draft motion to compel discovery responses	430.00	1.7	731.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/12/15] Steven Woodrow: review and organize (9) exhibits for Motion to Compel	430.00	1.6	688.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court's order striking Motion to Certify Class	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Armstrong re: case	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and revise renewed draft motion for class cert	330.00	2.7	891.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze court's order on motion for class cert	330.00	0.3	99.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing court's order striking motion to compel	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching local rule 3.01(a) and deciding how we violated	330.00	1.3	429.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit class certification motion prior to re-filing (to ward against pick offs)	430.00	1.1	473.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Order on motion to compel requiring GMRS to produce conforming privilege log and ordering additional meet and confer	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: order on motion to compel	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft email to S.Schwartz re: depositions	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting subpoena to Clvitas Inst. - includes 2 subpoenas, addenda, cover letter, and notice of subpoena	330.00	5.5	1,815.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching Civitas' registered agent	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Finalizing motion for class cert	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding current state of edits to class cert motion	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: striking of class cert motion	430.00	0.7	301.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ PPeluso re: editing of class cert placeholder motion	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review status of Gomez SCOUS petition	430.00	0.7	301.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Woodrow's edits to Civitas addenda - and further revising, editing, and proofing	330.00	3.4	1,122.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman re Civitas subpoenas	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Servicing Notice of Subpoena	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Schwartz's email saying our subpoena docs are blank, looking and seeing the aren't	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Serving hard copies of Civitas subpoena	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Arranging for service of Civitas subpoena in Raleigh	330.00	0.7	231.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft subpoenas and addenda to Civitas for information re: GMRS's calls	430.00	2.1	903.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso and S.Coleman re: Civitas requests	430.00	0.2	86.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Review rules for service of subpoena and serving notice of subpoena and filing requirements, if any (none located)	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails with GMRS counsel about our subpoenas	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: Civitas subpoena	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: client question (Armstrong)	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman S Woodrow	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Discussion w Woodrow about GMRS' privilege log	330.00	0.3	99.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS motion for privilege log	330.00	1.4	462.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Follow up conf w/ S.Coleman re: client question (.2); conf. w/ client (.3)	430.00	0.5	215.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
General	[Martin v. GMRS 07/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS privilege log	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Review email exchanges S Woodrow S Schwartz	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to client	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S.Schwartz	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: outstanding mediation costs from GMRS	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to S.Schwartz w/ client phone numbers	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman S Woodrow re Armstrong	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: K.Armstrong	430.00	0.2	86.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS's "Motion to Vacate or for Reconsideration and for Sanctions"	330.00	2.7	891.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS Motion to Vacate or Reconsider and for Sanctions filed in Martin case (Dkt. 54)(1.1); review docket for timeline of filings (.3)	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: motion to vacate, for reconsideration, and for sanctions	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Research Mediation confidentiality agreement (in resp. to GMRS's general accusation that Pltfs have breached) (.8); review Motion for Leave to File FAC and Exhibits A-D) (.8)	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Steve Woodrow regarding GMRS's motion for sanctions	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: filing motion for sanctions in MD Fla, Rule 11 standards and safe harbor	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: strategy for responding to sanctions	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Research re GMRS's Motion to Vacate and for Reconsideration and for Sanctions -- focusing on how GMRS's motion is itself subject to Rule 11 sanctions	330.00	4.25	1,402.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting Rule 11 Motion for Sanctions so as to comply with Rule 11's safe harbor	330.00	6.5	2,145.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft letter to S. Schwartz re: Rule 11 safe harbor (4.6), research Rule 11 cases and other authorities cited by GMRS in Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions re: first-to-file rule and "claim splitting" (2.2); edit and revise draft Rule 11 motion for sanctions re: GMRS improper Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions (3.3)	430.00	10.1	4,343.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Edit and review letter to S Schwartz re Rule 11 safe harbor (3); research Rule 11 cases cited by GMRS (2.5)	330.00	5.5	1,815.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Stefan Coleman re Motion for Sanctions	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional edits to Rule 11 Motion for sanctions against GMRS (2.2); and safe harbor letter (.5)	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revising of draft safe harbor letter to S. Schwartz (2.2)	430.00	2.2	946.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: strategy for combating GMRS sanctions motion	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of proposed motion for sanctions against GMRS: edit proc. history (1.6); revise statement of basis for the relief requested (.8); draft arg. sections re: Rule 11 safeharbor (2.1); "combined" sanctions motions (.7); section re: breach of mediation confidentiality (1.1); edit sec. re: GMRS's missed deadlines as basis for court's not considering its arguments (.9)	430.00	7.2	3,096.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 08/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review communications with client (Walsh)	430.00	0.4	172.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 08/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS's responses to document requests	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow s Coleman	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: case schedule	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft email to S.Schwartz re: need to modify case schedule and issues re: depositions	430.00	0.9	387.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing Steve Schwartz email re our sanctions letter	330.00	0.8	264.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re Schwartz's email responding to our safe harbor	330.00	0.2	66.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Schwartz email re: deposition, case schedule enlargement, and sanctions	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ client (Walsh)	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional conference with Steve Woodrow re sanctions	330.00	0.6	198.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: strategy for sanctions	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/10/15] Patrick Peluso: reviewing emails between S Woodrow and Schwartz re sanctions	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: sanctions, out of state filings, and related case matters	430.00	2.1	903.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Steve Woodrow regarding our strategy for handling GMRS's Motion to vacate/reconsider and for sanctions	330.00	1.3	429.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: strategy for response to GMRS Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions	430.00	1.3	559.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Review rough draft of opposition to GMRS Motion to Vacate	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ client re: case	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research re GMRS's Motion to Vacate or for Reconsideration and for Sanctions	330.00	2.75	907.50
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting response to GMRS's Motion to Vacate or for Reconsideration and for Sanctions	330.00	7.25	2,392.50
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow and clients re sanctions threat against us	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Steven Woodrow: legal research re: good cause/excusable neglect standard as applied by federal courts in Florida and 11th circuit (in re GMRS Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions)	430.00	1.8	774.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review and editing of Opposition to Motion to Vacate: revise introduction (1.3); edit statement of facts (2.4); revise argu. section re: failure to meet standard for reconsideration (1.8)	430.00	5.5	2,365.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ client Martin re: sanctions threat	430.00	0.3	129.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing email exchanges between Schwartz and Woodrow re sanctions and their refusal to produce info regarding non-NC surveys	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Review S Woodrow's edits to Motion to Vacate -- further revisions	330.00	4.1	1,353.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding his research into reconsideration standard	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails between Woodrow and Schwartz regarding sanctions, objections, and GMRS' request for medical records	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: standard for reconsideration (in re: GMRS's Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: sanctions motion and refusal to withdraw objection to producing info re: any out of state surveys (other than NH and NC) in the Martin case and other issues, including GMRS request for client's father's medical records	430.00	1.4	602.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Opposition to Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions: revise arg. re: discovery objections serving as basis for filing of separate lawsuits (2.9); revise intro (.4); edit draft arg. re: first-to-file rule (2.2); edit arg. re: "claim splitting" (1.1)	430.00	6.6	2,838.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Review S Woodrow's additional edits to motion to vacate opposition (1) and doing further revisions (5.7)	330.00	6.7	2,211.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revise draft Opposition to GMRS Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions: edit arg. resp to request for sanctions (2.4); revise arg. re: misstatement re: Schwartz request for deposition in Orlando instead of Boca Raton (1.7); revise arg. re: GMRS request to provide in camera proof of confidentiality violations (2.2); review and analyze brief for grammar, style, spelling, punctuation, and tone (1.3); review exhibits prior to filing (.2)	430.00	7.8	3,354.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Research ability of party to request non-party relative (Plaintiff Armstrong's father's) medical records: review HIPPA cases (1.3); review availability of protective order for harassing discovery (1.8)	430.00	3.1	1,333.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Research availability for sanctions for harassing and abusive discovery	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferences with Black Dog Service (Raleigh) re issues with Civitas subpoena	330.00	1	330.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into HIPPA -- can GMRS just request Armstrong's father's medical records?	330.00	6.8	2,244.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re Nelnet settlement	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Review recent TCPA class settlement w/ NelNet	430.00	0.6	258.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS First Set RTPS and Rogs to Plaintiffs	330.00	4.9	1,617.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow about responding to GMRS discovery requests	330.00	0.3	99.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS First Set of RTPs to Plaintiffs Martin and Armstrong (1.8); review GMRS First Set of Interrogatories to Martin and Armstrong (1.4); review GMRS Amended privilege log (and compare w/ prior privilege logs) (.9); review GMRS amended discovery responses and compare with prior responses (1.5)	430.00	5.6	2,408.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman and P.Peluso re: responding to GMRS discovery	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exhcngae Woodrow/Schwartz re discovery issues, sanctions	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order denying GMRS motion to vacate	330.00	0.4	132.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS's sup discovery responses	330.00	2.9	957.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding moving for sanctions against GMRS	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft email to S. Schwartz re: outstanding discovery, sanctions, case schedule and other issues	430.00	0.7	301.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS supplemental answers to Interrogatories and compare w/ prior answers	430.00	2.2	946.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Order denying GMRS Motion to Vacate or to Reconsider and for Sanctions and strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: moving for sanctions against GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Research sanctions Orders from Judge Presnell	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit draft Unopposed Motion to Enlarge Case Management Schedule	430.00	0.8	344.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email from Woodrow to Schwartz re GMRS's neglect in failing ot answer	330.00	0.25	82.50
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Review unopposed motion to modify CMC	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: GMRS failure to timely answer in Martin case, deposition dates, and req. that GMRS withdraw Notice to Transfer filed in Zilveti;	430.00	1.5	645.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: GMRS failure to answer Amended Complaint on time and technical default	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 08/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing order resetting deadline for joinder of parties	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS motion for leave to file amended complaint and amended complaint prior and email from S.Schwartz	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w. S.Schwartz re: GMRS proposed motion; certification language; and GMRS agreement to travel for Armstrong and Martin depositions	430.00	1.3	559.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS supplemental discovery	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferences with Black Dog re Clvitas service issues	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and finalize sanctions motion	330.00	1.8	594.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: status of Civitas subpoena	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Court's order denying sanctions and GMRS motion to vacate	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Final review of sanctions motion and exhibits prior to filing	430.00	1.4	602.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/25/15] Steven Woodrow: File motion for sanctions against GMRS and S.Schwartz	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Meet and Confer call with Schwartz	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing various email exchanges with Steve Schwartz, including when Schwartz said the case will get nasty	330.00	0.75	247.50
General	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing misc filings in advance of meet and confer	330.00	1.25	412.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow in advance of meet and confer	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and revising S Woodrow draft email summing up meet and confer	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow about how to handle Schwartz -- he said our litigation has turned nasty	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze email to Schwartz about his claim on the personal turn of events	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Discovery meet and confer phone call w/ S. Schwartz	430.00	0.5	215.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Steven Woodrow: prepare for discovery meet and confer w/ S. Schwartz: review prior motion to compel (.4); review priv. log (.3); review supplemental discovery responses (.7)	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft email summary of meet and confer and send to S.Schwartz	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and respond to Schwartz email indicating litigation has "nasty personal tone going forward."	430.00	2.2	946.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, revise, and amend draft discovery responses	330.00	2	660.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial outlining and draft responses to GMRS First Requests to Produce to Plaintiffs Armstrong and Martin (2.7); Draft and edit answers and objections to interrogatories (2.6); revise objections (.5)	430.00	5.8	2,494.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft outline of Second Motion to Compel against GMRS	430.00	2.6	1,118.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Further review of draft responses to GMRS' discovery request, editing and revising them	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Editing GMRS motion to compel draft, drafted by Woodrow	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 08/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising of second motion to compel: draft arg. re: GMRS clients (3.3); draft arg. re: limiting case to NH and NC consumers (1.7); draft intro (.8); revise statement of facts (2.3)	430.00	8.1	3,483.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Black Dog--service confirmed	330.00	0.3	99.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing service of process on Clvitas insittute	330.00	0.3	99.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow about Civitas institute	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ process server re: Civitas subpoena	430.00	0.2	86.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Motion to Compel ahead of 9/1 meet and confer	430.00	1.1	473.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise draft discovery responses for Martin and email to client	430.00	1.9	817.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Armstrong discovery responses and send to client for review	430.00	1.6	688.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 08/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ Civitas Institute (Francis Du Luca) (.4); conduct online research re: Du Luca and Civitas, research connection to political survey calling (.7)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS' brief filed in response to sanctions motion	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Patrick Peluso: researching viability of filing reply brief in MD FLA	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re GMRS' brief	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS response in Opp. to Mot. for Sanctions (2.3); review local rules re: filing reply briefs (.3)	430.00	2.6	1,118.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and drafting of Second Motion to Compel against GMRS	430.00	1.9	817.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w Schwartz re: status of outstanding discovery	430.00	0.6	258.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review GMRS Second Amended Ans to Rog No. 6 re: ATDS system and software used (.7); email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: subpoena to phone service provider (.3)	430.00	1	430.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Woodrow Decl in support of Second Motion to Compel	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Final edits to motion to compel, and preparing for filing	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize Second Motion to Compel and Exhibits GMRS and file Second Motion to Compel	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ client (Martin) re: discovery	430.00	0.4	172.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Receipt of documents from client	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Review docs received from client for prep of discovery responses	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ client (Martin) re: discovery responses	430.00	0.4	172.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising re Armstrong objections and responses to GMRS first RTPs	430.00	2.3	989.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, revise, and Editing draft case mgmt. statement	330.00	1.5	495.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Review client docs (Armstrong)	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: draft motion for leave to file reply brief ISO Mot to compel	330.00	2.5	825.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Final edits to responses to GMRS discovery reuquests	330.00	1.2	396.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Woodrow's edits to RTPS and ROGs responses, further editing and revising	330.00	2.5	825.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exchanges with Schwartz, Armstrong	330.00	0.5	165.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze order on motion for sanctions and findings that OA Schwartz has acted unprofessionally	430.00	0.5	215.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Futher drafting and editing of Martin's responses and objecitons to First Set of RTPs	430.00	1.6	688.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of Armstrong discovery responses (interrogatories and RTPS)	430.00	1.6	688.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange with S.Schwartz re: case deadlines	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ client (Armstrong)	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding discovery burdens	330.00	0.5	165.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Martin Answers and Objections to First Set of Interrogatories	430.00	2.2	946.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 09/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: discovery objections of relevance, proportionality, and burden	430.00	0.7	301.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Further conf w/ client (Armstrong) re: discovery	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS's motion for protective order and opp to motion to compel	330.00	3.8	1,254.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Schwartz' motion for oral argument	330.00	0.5	165.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Further revise and edit Martin responses to discovery	430.00	2.1	903.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS filing: Motion for Protective Order and Opposition to Second Motion to Compel and all exhibits	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow about filing Reply brief	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting request for reply brief	330.00	2.3	759.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Finalizing and filing request for reply brief ISO 2nd motion to compel	330.00	0.6	198.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit motion for leave to file Reply brief in support of Second Motion to Compel	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Email Schwartz re: meet and confer - does GMRS consent to allow filing of Reply brief (.1), review Schwartz response (.1)	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w. P.Peluso re: filing of Reply brief	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Editing opposition to request for oral argument and prepping for filing	330.00	0.9	297.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Final edits to GMRS answers to GMRS discovery	330.00	1.7	561.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize and serve Answers for Martin and Armstrong to GMRS discovery	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revise opposition to Request for Oral Argument	430.00	1.3	559.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 09/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing court order about reply briefs	330.00	0.5	165.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 09/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Court order allowing Reply brief up to 10 pages	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Outline Reply brief in support of Second Motion to Compel	430.00	1.6	688.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, editing, and revising reply iso motion to compel	330.00	5.5	1,815.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of Reply brief in Support of Second Motion to Compel: draft arg. re: factual inaccuracies (1.4); striking or discounting of Diana declaration (1.7); relevancy of GMRS's third party clients (2.3); arg. re: relevancy of scripts (1.3)	430.00	7	3,010.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Further review, editing, and revising reply in support of motion to compel	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 09/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research re reply iso 2nd motion to compel	330.00	4.2	1,386.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Further edit and revise Reply in Supp of Second Mot. to Compel: revise arg. re: docs actually sought (2.2); further drafting of opp arg. to req. for "scripts" (.9); edit opp. arg. to Declaration of A. Diana (2.7); draft arg. re: Rule 26(a)(1) disclosures (1.7); draft arg. re: GMRS misunderstandings re political calls, ATDS use, and consent (1.8)	430.00	9.3	3,999.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Francis De Luca from Civitas re: subpoena	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Further editing and revising 2nd motion to compel	330.00	6.2	2,046.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Woodrow's 2nd motion to compel reply -- proofing and further amending	330.00	3	990.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 09/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising of Reply in Support of Second Motion to Compel: revise arg. re: third party clients (2.3); edit section re: scripts (1.1); edit for clarity (2.8); revise arg. re: data and reports (2.6)	430.00	8.8	3,784.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re Civitas Institute	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with Civita's DeLuca	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Francis DeLuca from Civitas-Rule 26(a)(1) disclosed witness as likely to have info: DeLuca says never heard of GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails with Schwartz Woodrow about 2nd motion to compel	330.00	0.5	165.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting subpoenas to PBX -- including addenda, notice, subpoena docs, and cover letter	330.00	6.9	2,277.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching PBX's registered agent	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Communications with Process Server about PBX Subpoena service	330.00	0.5	165.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ Defense Counsel re: resetting hearing on Second Motion to Compel and GMRS Motion for Protective Order (.7); revise draft motion to reset by GMRS (.3)	430.00	1	430.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review and editing of PBX Subpoena documents, including addenda for docs and deposition topics (1.8); review cover letter and subpoena forms for service (.6)	430.00	2.4	1,032.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 09/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Settlement email to S.Schwartz	430.00	0.1	43.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 10/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Review information re: PBX subpoena	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and respond to S.Schwartz email re: resetting date for oral argument and other case deadlines	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow about motion to continue	330.00	0.4	132.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 10/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze court order indicating motion will be decided on the papers	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ PPeluso re: granting of motion to continue and denial of oral argument	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 10/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, editing, and revising opposition to GMRS' motion to reconsider	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 10/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise opposition to GMRS Motion to Reconsider: review docket and filings re: prior motions to reconsider (.6); draft argument re: ability to decide issues on briefs (3.2); revise args and edit for grammar and tone (.8)	430.00	4.6	1,978.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 10/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Court's order denying Motion for Reconsideration of denial of Oral Argument	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: denial of oral argument and reconsideration	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with GMRS' phone service provider	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze various emails with Schwartz about settlement	330.00	2	660.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ Martine Yaldor from pbx-change, GMRS's phone service provider, regarding burden of producing GMRS call records (over 20 million calls (includes both landline and cell) (.3);	430.00	0.3	129.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email from S.Schwartz re: settlement	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft email to R.Max (mediator) re: settlement discussions resuming	430.00	0.5	215.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Research and review methods and experts for analyzation of large data files (1.2); conf. w/ data experts (Sylint group) (1.0)	430.00	2.2	946.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 10/14/15] Patrick Peluso: reviewing and analyzing Judge's ORDER on 2nd motion to compel	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Strategy conference re settling the case with Woodrow and Coleman	330.00	1.7	561.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with mediator Rod Max	330.00	0.8	264.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy discussions w/ PPeluso and SColeman re: settlement negotiations	430.00	1.7	731.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 10/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Order granting in part and denying in part Second Motion to Compel discovery; strategy conf. re: discovery	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: further conferencing with Rod Max	330.00	1	330.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow and Coleman re mediation strategy	330.00	0.6	198.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max re: settlement	430.00	1.2	516.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Settlement discussions w/ PPeluso and S.Coleman in advance of mediation	430.00	0.6	258.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court Order granting Second Motion to Compel (.8); strategy conf. re: impact on mediation w/ S.Colman and P.Peluso (.3)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mediation	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/16/15] Patrick Peluso: assisting Woodrow in prep for mediation	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Prepare for GMRS mediation on Tuesday: review all court dockets and recent filings	430.00	2.3	989.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Martin v. GMRS 10/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Travel to Orlando from DEN for mediation	430.00	6	2,580.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Communication with Woodrow re status of mediation and proposals	330.00	4.5	1,485.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching FL state court case raised by Jeff Blakker regarding a blow up clause in a similar class action Old Dominion was just involved in	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Mediation in Orlando w/ mediator R. Max	430.00	8	3,440.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Martin v. GMRS 10/20/15] Steven Woodrow: travel back to DEN from Orlando mediation	430.00	7.5	3,225.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Communication with Woodrow about Blaker's referenced blow up settlement that apparently just happened in Tampa	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Research settlement ref. by J.Blaker at mediation per Blaker request re: blow up clause for too many claims getting filed--unprecedented	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with Max regarding settlement/mediation	330.00	1	330.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Supplemental research regarding blow up provision in settlement agreement	330.00	1.7	561.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding blowup provision in settlement	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max re: settlement	430.00	1	430.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial drafting and revisions to draft term sheet following mediation in Orlando	430.00	2.6	1,118.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: settlements containing "blow up" provisions when an excess of claims are filed (percentage) -- no such precedent found	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 10/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS' settlement proposal	330.00	2.5	825.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit proposed settlement term sheet: review and analyze S.Coleman and P.Peluso edits	430.00	3.4	1,462.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Review settlement from FL state court at request of Jeff Blacker re: blow up clause: (Florida First Financial v. Superior Pharmacy)	430.00	2.3	989.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: settlement termination provisions for claims rates in resp. to GMRS proposal.	430.00	1.9	817.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 10/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit Unopposed Motion to enlarge deadlines	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to R. Max and S.Schwartz/Jeff Blaker re: Unopposed Motion to Enlarge Deadlines until after GMRS responds to discovery	430.00	0.2	86.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS settlement proposal	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Def. settlement proposal (1.7); conf w/ S.Coleman and P.Peluso re: strategy re: mediation subgroups proposed by GMRS	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Rod Max	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Settlement strategy with Woodrow	330.00	0.8	264.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Supplemental research regarding representation of subclasses	330.00	1.9	627.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Confs. w/ R. Max re: new settlement terms proposed by GMRS (seeking relief for 1million consumers w/o putting forth additional resources/relief)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Settlement strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S. Schwartz re phone call	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 10/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Research re: ability of class representatives to represent subclasses (1.7); research re: notice issues in GMRS proposal (2.2)	430.00	3.9	1,677.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference R Max and Blaker	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max and Jeff Blaker	430.00	0.5	215.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze settlement research prepared by P.Peluso re: claims rates and projections under settlement	430.00	1.5	645.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft settlement email to R.Max	430.00	0.7	301.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit settlement email and email to Defendant's counsel and Old Dominion Counsel	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow re settlement projections	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing latest proposal from Blaker	330.00	2.5	825.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze settlement proposal email from J.Blaker, calculate projections (1.7)	430.00	1.7	731.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: differentiation of notice plan among subclasses where same identifying info is avail for all class members	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email received from GMRS's CEO, Tony Diana	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Confirm ethical and professional rules in FL and 11th Cir for direct communication w/ a party represented by an atty	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to GMRS counsel re: receipt of direct communication received from A. Diana	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Review response emails received from GMRS	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with J Blaker	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ J.Blaker re: settlement negotiations (.4); review and analyze GMRS settlement proposal (1.2)	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman re settlement negotiations	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman: Further negotiation of settlement terms	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference call Woodrow and Coleman regarding latest settlement proposal and strategy	330.00	1.5	495.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyzing Blaker/Woodrow emails about class members per year	330.00	0.2	66.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ J.Blaker re: figures by year for proposed settlement class	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: settlement proposal from GMRS and counterproposal	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and revising Woodrow draft email to Blaker/Max	330.00	0.7	231.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft, revise, and send settlement email to J.Blaker and R.Max	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exchanges with Blaker, Max, and Woodrow	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ mediator re: follow up from J.Blaker	430.00	0.5	215.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial outline of Martin v. GMRS settlement agreement	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with mediator Max	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, analyzing, and revising latest Woodrow draft settlement agreement	330.00	5.9	1,947.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing emails with Blaker Woodrow about per claim amount	330.00	0.4	132.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into our per claim amount -- is it approvable?	330.00	4.5	1,485.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Steven Woodrow: call w/ mediator re: settlement	430.00	0.5	215.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Further draft and revise settlement agreement: draft definitions (3.8); draft notice section (2.2); draft relief to class members (1.1); draft release (.7)	430.00	6.8	2,924.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ Old Dominion Counsel re: per claim amounts	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference Woodrow and Coleman about per claim amount	330.00	1.4	462.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Settlement discussions w/ S.Coleman re: decision on per claim amount	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Calls w/ settlement admins re: proposals re: settlement notice	430.00	1.3	559.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Settlement communications w/ Old Dominion counsel re: notice and per claim amounts	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Research recent TCPA class settlement per claim amounts	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email exchanges with Schwartz and Blaker (From Woodrow)	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Further analysis and revision of Woodrow settlement agreement edits	330.00	4.8	1,584.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and revising of draft settlement agreement: draft and edit recitals (1.7); revise definitions (1.1); revise release (.4); draft sections re: attys fees, incentive awards, and mic provisions (3.2)	430.00	6.4	2,752.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Further email exchange w/ GMRS and Old Dominion Counsel re: per claim amts	430.00	0.6	258.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 11/20/15] Patrick Peluso: reviewing and analyzing draft settlement agreement	330.00	2.75	907.50
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting of settlement agreement	430.00	5.3	2,279.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: notice bids from 3 settlement admins	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferences with Coleman and Woodrow	330.00	2.4	792.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with R Max	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: notice bids (.7); further research re: notice costs and law re: notice (and any conflicts from plaintiffs contributing to notice costs) (2.7)	430.00	3.4	1,462.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/23/15] Steven Woodrow: further drafting and revising of settlement agreement	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Participating in further settlement conferences	330.00	2.5	825.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email from Woodrow to GMRS about notice costs	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Research to find ANY other case where plaintiffs were expected to bear the cost of notice	330.00	5.8	1,914.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/24/15] Steven Woodrow: telephonic settlement negotiations w/ mediator (1.1); strategy conf responding to offers and notice issues (1.3); research class action notice reqs and TCPA class action notices (3.3)	430.00	5.7	2,451.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to GMRS counsel re: notice costs	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re state of settlement discussions	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and revise Woodrow draft settlement email	330.00	0.6	198.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Further settlement negotiations and conf. w/ administrators (2.5); draft and revise comprehensive settlement email to opposing counsel (1.9)	430.00	4.4	1,892.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 11/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: notice in class actions -- who bears costs (99% of time Defendants)	430.00	2.1	903.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 11/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Revise, edit, and amend latest Woodrow settlement agreement edits	330.00	3.4	1,122.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Follow up comm w/ R.Max re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ J.Blaker re: notice costs	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 11/30/15] Steven Woodrow: strategy conf w/ P.Peluso re: notice and admin	430.00	0.5	215.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Initial review of Woodrow's latest settlement agreement edits	330.00	0.8	264.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Update draft settlement agreement and circulate to P.Peluso and S.Coleman	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Coleman and S Woodrow settlement agreement edits	330.00	1.4	462.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional edits to settlement agreement	330.00	4.9	1,617.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email to Blakker from Woodrow about with settlement agreement attached	330.00	0.2	66.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft proposed "Short Form" settlement notice	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Blaker email with settlement edits	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow regarding settlement edits	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Initial draft long form notice drafted by woodrow	330.00	1.9	627.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Preliminary review of GMRS redline edits to settlement agreement	430.00	0.7	301.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft proposed "Long Form" website notice for proposed settlement agreement	430.00	5.2	2,236.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Review latest GMRS edits to settlement agr.	330.00	1.3	429.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Review long form notices in MD Fla cases	330.00	2.8	924.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS edits to draft Settlement Agreement: evaluate central changes	430.00	2.4	1,032.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise proposed claim form for GMRS settlement	430.00	1.9	817.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing draft claims form, direct mail, and website notice	330.00	3.6	1,188.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/06/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails Woodrow to Blaker, Max with notice forms	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of settlement documents: edit and revise draft short form mail notice (1.6); revise long form notice (2.3); revise claim form (.3)	430.00	4.2	1,806.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/06/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review and editing of GMRS edits to settlement agreement	430.00	0.8	344.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze KCC settlement admin proposal	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Woodrow email to Blaker about edits to settlement agreement	330.00	1.5	495.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow and Coleman re negotiations	330.00	0.8	264.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revise draft settlement agreement	430.00	1.6	688.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft settlement email for J.Blaker highlighting outstanding questions	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/07/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: settlement negotiations	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing communications about Schwartz's trial schedule	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email from Max about deference to Schwartz's trial schedule	330.00	0.2	66.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with Blaker and Woodrow about settlement	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/08/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ J.Blaker re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Review email from Jim Fallace	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding Fallace email	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from J.Fallace	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/11/15] Steven Woodrow: strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: Fallace email	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding need for more time	330.00	0.6	198.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Review case schedule and analyze need for motion to enlarge	430.00	1.4	602.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with R Max regarding settlement (Woodrow also present)	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with Woodrow regarding settlement strategy	330.00	0.8	264.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching how to request more time -- including local rules/standing orders	330.00	0.9	297.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R. Max re: negotiations	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Strategy conf. w/ P.Peluso re: settlement negotiations	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/16/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze email exchange between Max and Woodrow	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ R.Max re: negotiations	430.00	0.5	215.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Review local rules re: requests for additional time	430.00	0.7	301.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting motion to extend deadline to amend parties	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow about upcoming deadlines	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing docket to ensure compliance with upcoming deadlines	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze email from Schwartz about objection to extending deadlines to amend	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft Motion for Extension of Time	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Confer w/ GMRS re: moving for additional time	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: conference re Judge's order denying motion to extend	330.00	1.1	363.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and editing Max decl	330.00	1.2	396.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Woodrow decl	330.00	0.5	165.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge's endorsed order denying motion to extend	330.00	0.6	198.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Research into motions to reconsider in MD Fla (Presnell in particular)	330.00	3.9	1,287.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
General	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Judge's order re Class Cert motion	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court order denying extension of time	430.00	0.5	215.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft joint motion to reconsider order denying Unopposed Motion for an extension of time: draft introduction (1.2); edit and revise statement of facts (3.8); draft argu. section (3.2)	430.00	8.2	3,526.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Declaration of Mediator re: status of settlement progress	430.00	1.3	559.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Woodrow Decl.	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso and S.Coleman re: joint mot for additional time	430.00	0.9	387.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to GMRS Counsel re: court's denial of motion to enlarge and prejudice to Plaintiffs	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/19/15] Patrick Peluso: review emails about denial of motion to extend	330.00	0.6	198.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to GMRS counsel re: motion to reconsider denial of motion to enlarge time	430.00	0.8	344.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 12/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Review order on Plaintiffs' Motion for Class Certification, setting briefing deadlines	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Review mediator statement re: declaration	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit Woodrow Decl. in support of motion to reconsider denial of enlargement of time	430.00	1.2	516.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: standard on Motion to reconsider (1.7); research Judge Presnell Orders on reconsideration (1.2)	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Further review declaration of Rod Max ISO motion to reconsider	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Patrick Peluso: drafting, editing, revising motion to reconsider	330.00	7.4	2,442.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching page limit in GMRS motion to reconsider	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Steven Woodrow: conf w/ mediator re: costs (.1); conf w/ S.Coleman re: mediation expenses (.4)	430.00	0.5	215.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit request for oral argument on motion to reconsider	430.00	0.8	344.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Motion to Reconsider	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/21/15] Steven Woodrow: Email proposed Joint Motion for Reconsideration to S.Schwartz for review	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional research to use in support of our motion for reconsideration	330.00	1.4	462.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow regarding motion to reconsider	330.00	0.6	198.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of joint motion to reconsider	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R. Max re: motion to reconsider	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: strategy on motion to reconsider	430.00	0.5	215.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Final edits on motion for reconsideration	330.00	3.7	1,221.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with Max and Woodrow	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 12/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize Joint motion to reconsider denial of motion to enlarge prior to filing	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: settlement	430.00	0.5	215.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 12/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze order granting motion for reconsideration	330.00	0.9	297.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with max and woodrow	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ mediator re: settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 12/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze court order extending deadlines for filing any settlement agreement to Jan. 15 2016	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow S Coleman	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: settlement negotiations	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 12/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Research recent TCPA class actions re: claim amounts	430.00	2.6	1,118.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing latest GMRS settlement proposal	330.00	4.9	1,617.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing email from Blaker about GMRS' latest proposal	330.00	0.8	264.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Emails S Woodrow S Blaker regarding 2nd phase numbers	330.00	0.6	198.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in call with Max and Woodrow re emails from Blaker and settlement	330.00	0.6	198.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revis draft settlement agreement received from GMRS: rejected several provisions and redlines and accepted other changes (3.7); highlighted remaining comments (.9)	430.00	6.8	2,924.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman and P.Peluso re: proposed settlement edits and strategy for communicating them to GMRS	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from J.Blaker re: settlement terms	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: email from Blaker re: settlement terms	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 12/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Participate in further conference with Max about Blaker's settlement positions	330.00	0.7	231.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, proof, and amend latest Woodrow settlement edits	330.00	1.9	627.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Further conf. w/ mediator re: Blaker email	430.00	0.7	301.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 12/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Further review and analyze draft settlement agreement prior to sending to GMRS (2.1); review and analyze Blaker email re: settlement (1.7)	430.00	3.8	1,634.00
Total				278,419.50
Amount Paid				0.00
Balance Due (USD)				\$278,419.50

PAYMENT STUB

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
3900 E Mexico Ave
Suite 300
Denver CO
United States

Client	ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com
Invoice #	0000063
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$278,419.50
Amount Enclosed	

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States



ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice #	0000064
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$150,239.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise outline for motion preliminary approval of class action settlement: outlined sections of brief (2.2)	430.00	2.2	946.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Review caselaw for class certification in FL Fed Crt	430.00	1.9	817.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Research caselaw re: std on preliminary approval	430.00	1.8	774.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/03/16] Patrick Peluso: Initial edits/revisions to Woodrow's draft prelim approval motion	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/03/16] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of motion for preliminary approval: draft introduction and facts (3.1); draft sec. re: class certification (2.1); draft arg. re: std. for preliminary approval and application to settlement terms (2.7)	430.00	7.9	3,397.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/04/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research on preliminary approval in 11th Circuit, MD Fla in particular	330.00	6.4	2,112.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of Motion for preliminary approval: revise facts and intro (1.7); edit summary of settlement terms (1.8); revise class cert section (1.4); revise arg. re: settlement benefits, include comparison to other settlements (2.2)	430.00	7.1	3,053.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, editing, and revising Woodrow's draft motion for prelim approval	330.00	5.1	1,683.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails in which "patience" was requested	330.00	0.7	231.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/06/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ mediator re: progress of settlement	430.00	0.6	258.00
Discovery	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing insurance coverage documents for Mapfre insurance (4), researching likelihood of coverage (3.3)	330.00	7.3	2,409.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Woodrow re newly discovered \$4 million insurance policy and what it means for status of negotiations	330.00	2	660.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing joint motion for emergency hearing	330.00	0.8	264.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze emails with Max	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ S.Schwartz re: additional insurance	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Research prior GMRS disclosures re: insurance	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: GMRS "discovery" of potential additional insurance	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Mapfre insurance policies	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from Blaker re: settlement terms	430.00	0.5	215.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/16] Patrick Peluso: Researching Mapfre's coverage language	330.00	2.9	957.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/16] Steven Woodrow: Research re: party's obligation to disclose available insurance	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: Mapfre insurance	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/09/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ mediator and GMRS and Old Dominion re: new found insurance	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/10/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research regarding Mapfre's coverage -- particularly the "marketing" exclusion	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/10/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: potential additional insurance from Mapfre	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/10/16] Steven Woodrow: Further review and analyze Mapfre insurance policies	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/10/16] Steven Woodrow: Research FL insurance coverage law and TCPA exclusions	430.00	1.6	688.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/10/16] Steven Woodrow: Further review of GMRS insurance disclosures	430.00	0.6	258.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze order granting motion for extension of time	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference with Blaker Max Woodrow	330.00	0.5	165.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with Woodrow in advance of call this evening	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Old Dominion and GMRS counsel and mediator	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: impact of additional insurance on settlement terms	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 01/11/16] Steven Woodrow: Review court order providing until 3.18 to file settlement papers	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into Mapfre's impact -- if there is only coverage for 2010/2011, how that impact our settlement negotiations? Can we potentially get more \$ per class member?	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/16] Steven Woodrow: coordination of third mediation session with mediator and conference w/ mediator	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from S.Schwartz re: Mapfre insurance update	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: coverage for TCPA claims and FL insurance cases	430.00	1.3	559.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/14/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of draft settlement agreement: adjust definitions section (2.3); edit relief section and insurance information (3.3)	430.00	5.6	2,408.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/15/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, analyzing, and amending Woodrow's latest settlement agr draft	330.00	3.3	1,089.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/18/16] Patrick Peluso: Review emails about next mediation date	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 01/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into what happens to our claims if GMRS just goes bankrupt	330.00	5.9	1,947.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/19/16] Steven Woodrow: Review draft settlement agreement sent by GMRS (1.4); revise to include Mapfre contribution (2.9)	430.00	4.3	1,849.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Revise settlement agreement to account for transfer of Thompson case to FL and further edits re: Mapfre (2.1); conf w/ P.Peluso re: edits (.8)	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re latest settlement proposal	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and amending Woodrow's latest edits to settlement agreement	330.00	1.7	561.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/21/16] Steven Woodrow: Further revisions to draft settlement documents	430.00	3.6	1,548.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing latest settlement agreement	330.00	2.8	924.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Emailing S Schwartz about whether there's been news from Mapfre	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze S.Schwartz email. re: Mapfre update	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Further email exchanges w. GMRS counsel re: mapfre	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/29/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow - Mapfre coverage issues	330.00	0.8	264.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Further emails w/ mediator re: additional mediation with Mapfre	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Strategy conf w/ P.Peluso re: mapfre denial of coverage	430.00	0.8	344.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 01/30/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R. Max re: Mapfre denial of coverage	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/31/16] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with S Coleman re Mapfre	330.00	1.1	363.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 01/31/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mapfre basis for denial of coverage	430.00	1.1	473.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing case documents in advance of GMRS mediation	330.00	4.5	1,485.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Coleman regarding his findings on Mapfre coverage	330.00	1.1	363.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/01/16] Steven Woodrow: Review settlement documents and edits, review insurance documents and GMRS insurance emails and disclosures in advance preparation for mediation	430.00	3.3	1,419.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow re mediation strategy	330.00	3.75	1,237.50
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Patrick Peluso: conference with insurance defense attorney about Mapfre's position on coverage	330.00	4.7	1,551.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Mapfre declination of coverage	330.00	6.1	2,013.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Strategy session w. P.Peluso re: mediaton prior to session	430.00	1.6	688.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Travel to mediation from Denver to Boca Raton (through Ft. Lauderdale)	430.00	9	3,870.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Schwartz email and attached 14-page Mapfre denial of insurance coverage (2.8)	430.00	2.8	1,204.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/02/16] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: grounds for denial of insurance coverage	430.00	3.7	1,591.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/16] Patrick Peluso: Travel to GMRS mediation in Boca Raton	330.00	4	1,320.00
General	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/16] Patrick Peluso: Travel back to Denver - GMRS mediation	330.00	9	2,970.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/16] Patrick Peluso: Mediation in Boca Raton	330.00	7	2,310.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/16] Steven Woodrow: Third Mediation Session in Boca Raton	430.00	7	3,010.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 02/03/16] Steven Woodrow: Travel back to Den from Boca Raton (Ft. Lauderdale Airport)	430.00	9	3,870.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/16] Patrick Peluso: Strategy about phase 2 of these negotiations	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Strategy meeting re: phase 2 negotiations (K.England, P.Peluso, S.Coleman)	430.00	0.4	172.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into why GMRS keeps wanting to insert a fraud waiver into our agreement	330.00	3.9	1,287.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ J. Blaker re: settlement	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/06/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and make preliminary edits and comments to draft settlement agreement and documents in email from S.Schwartz	430.00	3.7	1,591.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow S Coleman - status of mediation negotiations	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing latest GMRS settlement proposals	330.00	2.4	792.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S.Coleman re: mediation phone call negotiations	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/09/16] Patrick Peluso: Review email on Update from Mapfre	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails about Iodestar	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/12/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into whether class action P counsel must share info about phase 2	330.00	1.9	627.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/13/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing communications from Max/Woodrow on settlement status	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/13/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ mediator re: moving forward w/ settlement negotiations and outstanding issues	430.00	0.5	215.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ R.Max re: brackets	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/18/16] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conference with mediator Max	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/18/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w. R. Max re: mediation and settlement terms	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow regarding settlement	330.00	1.3	429.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails exchanged with Max	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Schwartz email about outstanding issues	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ PPeluso re: settlement strategy	430.00	1.1	473.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ mediator re: settlement negotiations	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchanges w/ mediator re: settlement	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Emails w/ mediator and insurer's counsel re: settlement	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into whether GMRS can move to enforce settlement	330.00	6.4	2,112.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/16] Patrick Peluso: Participate in conferences with R Max and Blakker	330.00	0.7	231.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/16] Patrick Peluso: Researching viability of taking fees to the court -- Presnell's experience with fees, 11th Circuit standard	330.00	5.9	1,947.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max prior to call w/ J.Blacker	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/24/16] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ J.Blaker re: settlement authority	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Further research into whether it is viable for us to leave fees to crt	330.00	4.7	1,551.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: settlement	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Review settlement draft received from J.Blaker	430.00	0.9	387.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 02/26/16] Patrick Peluso: Further Legal research into fee calculation for MD Fla after hearing latest proposal from GMRS (basically Iodestar)	330.00	4.9	1,617.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 02/29/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference S Woodrow s coleman regarding leaving fees to court	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 02/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise proposed billing memo for review by Old Dominion Counsel	430.00	2.7	1,161.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/03/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and revise Steve's edits to Old Dominion's draft settlement agreement	330.00	1.2	396.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/03/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and Redline Edit Settlement Agreement draft sent for review by Old Dominion Counsel	430.00	3.6	1,548.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft settlement agreement and claim form and notices (1.3); email docs to S.Schwartz (.1)	430.00	1.4	602.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/16] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, and revise Woodrow draft prelim approval brief	330.00	2.3	759.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Communications (email exchange) w/ S.Schwartz re: Schwartz raising issue of discovery related to attorneys fees request and wanting 75 days to take fees discovery (.4); conf w/ mediator (.2)	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of draft Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement: revised sec. re: certifiability of settlement class (2.8); edit. factual background and procedural history (1.8)	430.00	4.6	1,978.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/23/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from Settlement Administrator re: CAFA mailing (review recipient list for completion, analysis of docs requested by SA)	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Review emails between Woodrow and Settlement Admin regarding notice	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and respond to emails from Settlement Administrator re: CAFA notice	430.00	0.7	301.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: CAFA notice	430.00	0.4	172.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/27/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange re: CAFA notice with settlement administrator and opposing counsel	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/28/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ SA and GMRS counsel re: CAFA notice mailing	430.00	0.4	172.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/29/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Court's grant of prelim approval	330.00	0.3	99.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court order granting preliminary approval of class action settlement	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Draft email to SA and opposing counsel re: preliminary approval and triggered deadlines	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 03/30/16] Steven Woodrow: Review email from Settlement Administrator re: notice, website, and IVR	430.00	0.3	129.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 03/31/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange with settlement administrator re: notice documents	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/01/16] Steven Woodrow: Email requested documents in word format to Settlement Administrator	430.00	0.6	258.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze updated IVR from settlement administrator	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal Research regarding Rule 23 requirement that class members receive fee petition before opt-out date	330.00	0.7	231.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Drafting Unopposed Motion to Amend Schedule for Optout/Objections	330.00	1.1	363.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Final Review of Unopposed motion to amend schedule for opt outs (.3) and filing it (.1)	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ counsel for GMRS re: deadline for opting out/objecting prior to submission of fee brief	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft motion to enlarge opt out/objection deadline	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ Settlement Admin re: potential change to opt out/objection deadline	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Further email exchange with SA and counsel for GMRS re: IVR	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze formatted notice docs sent by administrator	330.00	0.3	99.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing sample settlement website set up by administrator	330.00	0.5	165.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/06/16] Steven Woodrow: Review, analyze, and approve Settlement Administrator's edits to Short form notice, Long form notice, and the Claim Form	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails from the last week between S Woodrow, S Schwartz, and settlement admin	330.00	0.8	264.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/08/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze draft website www.MartinTCPAsettlement.com and provided email comments for edits to Settlement Admin and GMRS Counsel	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/12/16] Steven Woodrow: conf. w/ settlement admin re: GMRS's production of Class List and the need to run "reverse lookups"	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and respond to email from Settlement Admin re: reverse look ups	430.00	0.2	86.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze settlement agreement provisions re: generation of Class List and performance of reverse look ups	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/12/16] Steven Woodrow: Research cases requiring fees to be filed before opt out/objection deadline	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 04/13/16] Steven Woodrow: Research re: attorneys fees in Fla Fed. Crts and 11th Cir. in preparation for drafting Motion for Reasonable Attorneys Fees (reviewed Lepinske v. Mercedes Homes, Inc., Poertner v. Gillette Co, David v. Am. Suzuki Motor Corp etc.)	430.00	2.1	903.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/19/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email exchange with Settlement administrator and GMRS counsel re: mailing notice	430.00	0.4	172.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 04/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Review emails with Woodrow/Admin/Schwartz re notice	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ settlement administrator and GMRS counsel re: mailed notice and reverse look ups	430.00	0.3	129.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 04/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Review caselaw re: reverse look ups and timing	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 04/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS counsel's email re: mailings and reverse look ups	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Comm. w/ Settlement Admin re: posting of GLN number on settlement website and requirement that email address be supplied	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ settlement class members re: filing claims	430.00	1.1	473.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Review voicemails from settlement class members (.7); return calls with settlement class members re: filing of claims (1.7)	430.00	2.4	1,032.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/09/16] Patrick Peluso: Strategy session with Woodrow about how to respond to the wave of class members' calls	330.00	0.4	132.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/09/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: efficiently logging and returning of phone calls	430.00	0.4	172.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/10/16] Steven Woodrow: Review voicemails received from Class Members (.6); return class member calls and assist with claims filing (2.1)	430.00	2.7	1,161.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/11/16] Steven Woodrow: Review 50 voicemails received from settlement class members (.6); return calls to class members (1.2)	430.00	1.8	774.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/13/16] Steven Woodrow: Listen to class member voicemails (.7); return calls to settlement class members and assist with claims process (1.5)	430.00	2.2	946.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Review settlement class member voicemails (.5) and return calls to class members (1.2)	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/17/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Glass re: returning calls to Settlement Class Members	430.00	1.1	473.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/17/16] Rachel Glass: Returned the calls of 100 people that had called the firm regarding the Legal Notice that had been sent out notifying them of their potential part in the class action settlement.	100.00	6	600.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/18/16] Steven Woodrow: Record voicemails onto Settlement Spreadsheet	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/19/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R.Glass re: calls w/ class members (.5); review voicemails from class members (.6)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/19/16] Rachel Glass: Returned the calls of 65 people who had received the Legal Notice. Submitted 20 claim forms over the phone.	100.00	4.1	410.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Updating settlement class member call spreadsheet with the wave of new calls	330.00	1.2	396.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/23/16] Patrick Peluso: Calling and speaking with class members who have left voicemails	330.00	0.4	132.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 05/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Listen and review voicemails	430.00	0.5	215.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Calls w/ class members re: filing of claims	430.00	1.1	473.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 05/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: attorney fees in 11th Circuit and review of Hensley v. Eckerhart re: fees resulting in second major litigation	430.00	2.1	903.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 05/27/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Settlement Class Members re: filing claims	430.00	1.1	473.00


Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/10/16] Rachel Glass: Returned calls from settlement class members who contacted the firm after receiving notice of the settlement and assisted two callers in submitting settlement claim forms.	100.00	2.3	230.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/13/16] Steven Woodrow: Review docket and filings in preparation for drafting Motion for Reasonable Attorneys Fees: review discovery & discovery related motions, (First and Second Motions to Compel, GMRS Motion for a Protective Order) (2.6); reviewed discovery correspondence (1.4); reviewed settlement correspondence (1.1); reviewed mediation notes and briefing (.8); reviewed outline for fee briefing and sample fee motions (1.3); reviewed settlement agreement and preliminary approval papers (.5)	430.00	7.5	3,225.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/14/16] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of outline for facts and argument in Motion for Attorneys Fees	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/15/16] Steven Woodrow: Further revisions to Motion for Attorneys Fees: revise outline and draft argument headings (2.4); draft and edit introduction (2.3); draft Johnson factor re: skill of attorneys (.3); draft arg. re: novel defense arguments (.8); review and update firm resume (.8)	430.00	6.6	2,838.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Further draft and revise Motion for Reasonable attorneys fees: first draft of comparable TCPA settlements and awards (2.8); draft and revise statement of facts (3.3)	430.00	6.1	2,623.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/16/16] Steven Woodrow: Review TCPA settlements and awards and claims rates	430.00	1.8	774.00
Meetings	[Martin v. GMRS 06/17/16] Steven Woodrow: Prepare for AG conference call: review settlement documents, notices, mailing and claim statistics, and review fee information	430.00	1.4	602.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/17/16] Steven Woodrow: Conference with attorneys general group from Florida, Texas, and California	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/17/16] Rachel Glass: Returned calls from settlement class members who contacted the firm after receiving notice of the settlement.	100.00	0.5	50.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Further legal research re: fee awards in TCPA class actions	430.00	1.8	774.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/21/16] Steven Woodrow: Draft outline of Woodrow Declaration in support of fees (3.2); further revise fee motion for grammar, spelling, and formatting (1.2)	430.00	4.4	1,892.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Research re: Florida expert in attorneys fees in consumer class actions for MD FL	430.00	1.2	516.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revising of draft Motion for Attorneys Fees: draft and edit explanation of considerations under Johnson (.8); draft sec. re: awards in comparable cases (2.8); revise intro (.3); edit sec re: awards in non TCPA cases (1.3)	430.00	5.2	2,236.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/23/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees: revise background facts (1.8); further drafting of Johnson factors (2.1); edit headings (.3)	430.00	4.2	1,806.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/27/16] Patrick Peluso: Initial review of draft fee brief and providing feedback to S Woodrow	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/27/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Motion for Reasonable Attys Fees: revise sec re: relief obtained and risks of continued litigation (1.6); revise facts (1.3)	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 06/27/16] Steven Woodrow: Review further case law re: fees in TCPA common fund class action settlements	430.00	1.7	731.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/28/16] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Woodrow Declaration in support of Motion for Attorneys Fees: edit and revise paragraphs re: GMRS novel arguments (1.4); edit allegations re: class counsel experience (.7); revise allegations re: rates (.8)	430.00	2.9	1,247.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 06/28/16] Rachel Glass: Returned calls from settlement class members who contacted the firm after receiving notice of the settlement and helped one called to submit settlement claim form.	100.00	0.3	30.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/28/16] Taylor Smith: Proof brief in support of motion for attorneys fees (.5)	100.00	0.5	50.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/28/16] Taylor Smith: draft motion to extend page limit for attorneys' fee brief (.2)	100.00	0.2	20.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Patrick Peluso: Compiling Expense Report in Advance of Motion for Attorneys Fees	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Patrick Peluso: Review motion for additional pages re Attorneys' Fees Brief	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Steven Woodrow: Further drafting and editing of Motion for Attorneys' Fees: revise Johnson factors (2.1); revise introduction and facts (1.6)	430.00	3.7	1,591.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Taylor Smith: Draft motion to extend page for attorneys' fees motion (.2)	100.00	0.2	20.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Taylor Smith: Proof, revise and review fees brief in support of motion including updating cites, formatting, and adding TOA, and TOC (3.5)	100.00	3.5	350.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Taylor Smith: Proofread and edit brief in support of fees motion (.5)	100.00	0.5	50.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/29/16] Taylor Smith: Proof read and edit brief in support of motion for attorneys' fees (4.4)	100.00	4.4	440.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/16] Patrick Peluso: Conducting lodestar analysis for Fee Brief	330.00	1.5	495.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/16] Steven Woodrow: Edit draft of Woodrow Declaration: revise allegations re unsupported arguments raised by GMRS (3.4); further drafting of background facts (.7)	430.00	4.1	1,763.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/16] Steven Woodrow: Edit and revise draft Motion for Reasonable Attorneys Fees: revise introduction and factual background (1.1); further revisions to percentage factors under Johnson (.8); lodestar analysis as point of comparison (1.7)	430.00	3.6	1,548.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/16] Taylor Smith: Review and edit fee brief (3.3)	100.00	3.3	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 06/30/16] Taylor Smith: Proof and review brief in support of motion for attorneys' fees (1.4)	100.00	1.4	140.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/01/16] Patrick Peluso: Editing and revising Motion for Attorneys fees: 2.7 hours revising Argument section, 1 hour revising factual background and docket cites, and .3 on verifying the lodestar math is accurate	330.00	4	1,320.00
Settlement	[Martin v. GMRS 07/01/16] Steven Woodrow: Final read-through of brief for typos and minor edits prior to filing	430.00	1.1	473.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/01/16] Taylor Smith: Proof and edit brief in support of motion for attorneys' fees (1.3)	100.00	1.3	130.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/04/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re Schwartz's email about Fee-Related discovery	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze email from S.Schwartz demanding depositions and an evidentiary hearing on attorneys fees (.6); review case law on hearings and fees-related discovery (1.1)	430.00	1.7	731.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/04/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ P.Peluso re: Schwartz email re: fees-related discovery	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Drafting Notice of Opposition	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS's Motion for Extension, etc.	330.00	1	330.00
Communication	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Coleman re GMRS's Motion for Extension	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: fees-related discovery and prohibition against creating second "major litigation"	430.00	1.8	774.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Steven Woodrow: Draft and revise Opposition to GMRS Motion for an Extension of Time, to Compel Fees discovery and for Fees Depositions and for an Evidentiary Hearing on attorneys fees: review motion filed by GMRS (1.1); review case emails re: GMRS assertion of trial schedule (1.4); draft arg. re: prohibition against creating "second major litigation" (2.1); draft arg. re: relevancy and proportionality of information requested (1.8); draft arg. re: counsel's use of "I'm on trial" excuse (1.3)	430.00	7.7	3,311.00
Research	[Martin v. GMRS 07/05/16] Taylor Smith: Research case law re: fees related discovery (3.5)	100.00	3.5	350.00

Total	150,239.50
Amount Paid	0.00
Balance Due (USD)	\$150,239.50

This invoice was sent using 

PAYMENT STUB

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States

Client	ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com
Invoice #	0000064
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$150,239.50
Amount Enclosed	

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States



ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice #	0000060
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$57,288.50

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S. Coleman re: California GMRs case, strategy conf. re: complaint and motion for class cert (given acceptance of Gomez cert petition)	430.00	0.6	258.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Zilveti factual docs, phone information	430.00	0.7	301.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re CA state law claims for autodialed calls	430.00	1.2	516.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Review, edit, and revise draft complaint	330.00	3.2	1,056.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Coleman and S Woodrow re Complaint's allegations	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze proposed placeholder motion for filing in CA GMRS case	430.00	2.5	1,075.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 05/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial editing of Complaint	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing and revising draft placeholder certification motion for filing in CA litigation	430.00	2.2	946.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit draft Zilveti Complaint	430.00	2.8	1,204.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S. Coleman re: Zilveti filing	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Further legal research re: CA state law claims re: autodialed calls for potential addition to CA lawsuit	430.00	2.3	989.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ local counsel re: case against GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with M O'Connor re GMRS complaint/class cert motion	330.00	0.5	165.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting summons and civil cover sheet for filing	330.00	0.6	198.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Review Woodrow edits to class cert motion, edit, revise, amend further	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Further editing of Zilveti pleadings in advance of filing	430.00	1.7	731.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review recent TCPA decisions in ND CA prior to finalizing complaint	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ local counsel in CA re: GMRS	430.00	0.6	258.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Finalizing complaint for filing	330.00	2	660.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Finalizing class cert motion for filing	330.00	1.7	561.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/03/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Local Counsel re: GMRS complaint and class cert motion	430.00	0.4	172.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Initial case assignment (Dkt 2)	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Coordinate filing w/ Local Counsel	430.00	0.2	86.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Reviewed filed documents: complaint, cover sheet, and summons	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Magistrate Judge Kandis Westmore	430.00	0.7	301.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Draft proposed order re class cert motion	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Contacting ECF clerk re docket error	330.00	0.3	99.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Review filed class cert motion (Dkt 3)	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Review email and proposed order sent by M O'Connor to Judge's email address	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Final revisions to placeholder certification motion	430.00	2.3	989.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and approve draft proposed order	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w PPeluso re: filing of placeholder certification motion and correction of the docket	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Comm w/ Local re: placeholder motion	430.00	0.2	86.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Confer with M O'Connor regarding need for summons to issue	330.00	0.25	82.50
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Communiations with process server regarding need for service on GMRS - Melbourne, FL	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing issued summons	330.00	0.1	33.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing initial case management order	330.00	0.4	132.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Review order setting CMC	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting and filing pro hac vice applications for Steve and Pat	330.00	0.75	247.50
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and approve Zilveti pro hac vice application	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Read ND Cal Magistrate Brochure	330.00	1.5	495.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Approve Magistrate Consent form	430.00	0.2	86.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review court's history w/ TCPA litigation and class actions	430.00	0.8	344.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow M O'Connor regarding consent to magistrate	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed declination of magistrate	330.00	0.1	33.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing declination of magistrate form	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Coordinate w/ local counsel to file PHV applications	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Coordinate w/ local re: filing of magistrate consent form	430.00	0.3	129.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/22/15] Patrick Peluso: reviewing order reassigning case	330.00	0.1	33.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Factual research into new judge - Chesney	330.00	0.2	66.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing clerk's notice regarding pending reassignment	330.00	0.1	33.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Order re: reassignment of judge: (.2); review TCPA case law: judge Chesney (.4)	430.00	0.6	258.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing judge's cmc order	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching newly assigned judge Chesney, including class action experience cases	330.00	2.3	759.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Review case management scheduling order	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ local counsel re: call from Ian Rambaran, for GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: GMRS counsel in CA	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/25/15] Patrick Peluso: Communicating proof of service to interested parties	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ I. Rambaran for GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/25/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Zilveti proof of service	430.00	0.2	86.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing orders granting pro hac admission	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/26/15] Steven Woodrow: conf w/ P.Peluso re: Zilveti counsel	430.00	0.4	172.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 06/26/15] Steven Woodrow: Review grant of pro hac vice application	430.00	0.1	43.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS draft stip to extend	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails between Rambarran, O'Connor, Woodrow	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing local rule 5.1 after Rambarran raised an e-signature issue	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/01/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and approve proposed stipulation for extension of time for GMRS to file responsive pleading and request to continue initial cmc	430.00	0.8	344.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing judge's order approving stipulation for extension of time	330.00	0.2	66.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS Notice of Appearance - Rambarran	330.00	0.1	33.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/02/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed stipulation/proposed order	330.00	0.1	33.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Schwartz PHV and Rambaran appearance	430.00	0.2	86.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review court order granting extension of time to GMRS	430.00	0.2	86.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/09/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing judge's order setting deadlines for CMC/CMC Statement	330.00	0.2	66.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Review Schwartz's pro hac vice motion	330.00	0.1	33.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS' notice of pendency of other actions	330.00	0.75	247.50
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow regarding GMRS' notice of pendency	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Review legal standard for notice of pendency of related actions	430.00	1.2	516.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS notice of pendency of other actions	430.00	0.8	344.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS notice of appearance	330.00	0.1	33.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: stds for finding cases are "related"	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft Opposition to Notice of Pendency of Related Actions filed by GMRS	430.00	1.8	774.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS' motion to dismiss or transfer	330.00	1.5	495.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Initial research into GMRS' motion to dismiss/transfer	330.00	0.5	165.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS' exhibits re motion to dismiss	330.00	0.3	99.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/22/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS cert of interested persons	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS Motion to Dismiss and Transfer	430.00	1.6	688.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order granting pro hac vice admission	330.00	0.1	33.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Review first to file rule and claims splitting law cited by GMRS in motion to dismiss/transfer	430.00	1.9	817.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Courts order resetting deadlines re motion to dismiss/transfer	330.00	0.1	33.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order directing Defendant to notify the US that it claims a statute is unconstitutional	330.00	0.2	66.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/24/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into whether Plaintiff has a remedy for GMRS' failure to notify US	330.00	0.5	165.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Filing Notice of Opposition to GMRS's Notice of Pendency	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing, proofing, and modifying draft of opposition to GMRS' notice of pendency of related actions	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing additional S Woodrow edits to opp re notice of pendency	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Patrick Peluso: Final edits to opp to notice of pendency	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: Zilveti Order directing service on US re: constitutionality challenge	430.00	0.3	129.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Zilveti Order requiring service on United States of GMRS's claims of unconstitutionality.	430.00	0.2	86.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: Rule 5.1 and notice of claims of unconstitutionality (1.2); research caselaw upholding constitutionality (.7)	430.00	1.9	817.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft Opposition to GMRS's Notice of Pendency of Other Actions: research Civil Local Rule 3-13 (.6); draft and edit opposition (2.6)	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ S. Coleman re: Zilveti notice of pendency of other actions	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize opposition to GMRS notice of related case	430.00	3.2	1,376.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS' notice of constitutionality	330.00	1	330.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Researching merits of GMRS' notice constitutionality argument	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/30/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow regarding GMRS' constitutionality arguments	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze GMRS Notice of Claim of Unconstitutionality and exhibits	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Schwartz email to DOJ re: claim of unconstitutionality	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 08/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Jean Michel Voltaire at DOJ re: US entering Zilveti matter re: constitutionality	430.00	0.5	215.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 08/12/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing US' motion for extension of time	330.00	0.2	66.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 08/12/15] Steven Woodrow: Review extension of time for DOJ	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 08/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Court's order granting US' motion for enlargement, revising briefing schedule, continuing CMC	330.00	0.2	66.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 08/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Order on enlargement of time	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Schwartz Declaration filed in support of transfer	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email from Schwartz office to DOJ	430.00	0.1	43.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting response to GMRS Motion to Dismiss/Transfer	330.00	6.5	2,145.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with M O'Connor regarding GMRS hearing dates (Zilveti)	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Woodrow edits to response re GMRS' motion to dismiss or transfer	330.00	1.5	495.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional edits/ proofing to GMRS response mtd/transfer	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 09/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Inserting Table of Contents/Table of Authorities to response re MTD/transfer	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/09/15] Steven Woodrow: Review motion to transfer in Zilveti and opposition filed in Thompson matter	430.00	0.8	344.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research to support opposition to MTD/Transfer	330.00	4.9	1,617.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/14/15] Patrick Peluso: drafting opposition to GMRS Motion to dismiss/transfer	330.00	9.3	3,069.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/14/15] Steven Woodrow: strategy conf. re: Zilveti Opposition	430.00	1.2	516.00
Settlement	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ R. Max re: settlement possibilities	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Woodrow's edits to my opposition brief and doing further revisions	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: reading and analyzing US' intervention brief	330.00	2.9	957.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow regarding US' positions	330.00	0.4	132.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing communications with S Woodrow and R Max regarding US' positions	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed response to MTD/transfer	330.00	0.1	33.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft Zilveti Opposition: edit arg. re: first to file rule (1.9); revise arg. re: claim splitting (1.8); review and analyze arg. re: California telephone survey laws (1.4); review and edit introduction (1.8); revise for tone and grammar (2.3)	430.00	10.2	4,386.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze United States as Intervenor's brief in support of constitutionality of the TCPA	430.00	1.1	473.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing GMRS's notice of change in counsel	330.00	0.1	33.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Review notice of change in counsel filed by D.Chinn	430.00	0.1	43.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/26/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge's order that we send chambers copies	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Schwartz email regarding Need to move hearing to accommodate his trial schedule	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow regarding Schwartz's request	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 10/30/15] Steven Woodrow: Review email from S.Schwartz and analyze for breaches of mediation confidentiality (.3); send draft email to mediator (.2)	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 11/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed stipulation/proposed order to continue hearing on MTD/transfer	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 11/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit draft stipulation to continue in Zilveti	430.00	0.5	215.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 11/05/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing judge's order granting stipulation for continuance	330.00	0.2	66.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 11/05/15] Steven Woodrow: Review Order granting continuance of hearing on GMRS motion to transfer	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing D Chinn's email re proposed stipulation	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and analyzing GMRS's draft joint stip	330.00	0.25	82.50
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/07/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed stipulation to continue hearing on MTD	330.00	0.1	33.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing judge's order setting/resetting deadlines	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/08/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge's order granting continuance	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/18/15] Patrick Peluso: Confirming that CMC has been moved	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: inquiry from client re: public information about her lawsuit	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 12/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w Nicole Zilveti re: litigation and prospects for settlement	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 01/13/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Schwartz re: continuing deadlines in Zilveti via sitpulation	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 01/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange re: stipulation to continue hearing on motion to dismiss or transfer	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 01/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze judge's order vacating hearing	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 01/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze GMRS's notice of recent decision (the Thompson case)	330.00	0.75	247.50
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 01/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Confer with S Woodrow regarding notice of recent decision	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/16/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze Court's Order on GMRS's motion to dismiss or transfer	330.00	2.5	825.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/17/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Order denying motion to transfer in Zilveti matter (1.7); compare w/ Thompson Order (.8)	430.00	2.5	1,075.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Researching Local Rules and standing order to find Judge Chesney's procedures regarding appearing at CMC's by phone	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Emailing Judge Chesney's clerk to inquire on appearing at CMC by phone	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Researching docket regarding CMC statement due date	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Drafting CMC statement	330.00	3.5	1,155.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Emails with S Woodrow regarding CMC statement being due	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails between S Woodrow and S Schwartz regarding the need for GMRS's edits to draft CMC Statement and the due date	330.00	0.2	66.00


Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/19/16] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft CMC statement	430.00	1.8	774.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails between S Woodrow and S Schwartz regarding GMRS's edits to CMC Statement	330.00	0.6	198.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferring with S Woodrow regarding GMRS's CMC position	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails with S Woodrow and R Max regarding posture of GMRS' position and disclosure of mediation communications	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Confer with M O'Connor regarding CMC statement	330.00	0.4	132.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing edited CMC after conferrals - approving of new version	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing filed version of CMC statement	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: CMC statement (.6) and edits to statement (.6)	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing emails regarding GMRS's position on telephonic CMC	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing draft stipulation to appear by phone	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/22/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing email response from Judge's clerk re CMC appearance and conferring with S Woodrow on how to proceed (obtain GMRS permission to stipulate)	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ SGS re: appearance by telephone at CMC	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/23/16] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge's Order approving telephone cmc	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/23/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with K England regarding Zilveti and THompson competing orders	330.00	1.5	495.00
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/23/16] Steven Woodrow: Review stipulation re: appearance at CMC by telephone	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/26/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow re CMC	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/26/16] Patrick Peluso: Review and analyze minute order from CMC	330.00	0.3	99.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Telephonic CMC in Zilveti	430.00	1	430.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
General	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Preparation for telephonic CMC in Zilveti: review CMC statement (.3); review communications re: case management and settlement (.6)	430.00	0.9	387.00
Communication	[Zilveti v. GMRS 02/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ PPeluso re: CMC	430.00	0.3	129.00

Total **57,288.50**

Amount Paid 0.00

Balance Due (USD) **\$57,288.50**

This invoice was sent using 

PAYMENT STUB

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States

Client ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice # 0000060

Invoice Date July 6, 2016

Balance Due (USD) \$57,288.50

Amount Enclosed

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
 3900 E Mexico Ave
 Suite 300
 Denver CO
 United States



ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com

Invoice #	0000061
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$29,182.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/02/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ A. Thompson	430.00	0.3	129.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/04/15] Steven Woodrow: Initial review of draft Thompson complaint received from S.Coleman	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing draft complaint (.3) and draft initial class cert motion (.7)	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/14/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze edited Thompson v. GMRS complaint	430.00	0.7	301.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing edits to draft complaint (edits from S Woodrow)	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/17/15] Patrick Peluso: Review class cert draft (edits from S Woodrow)	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Revise and edit draft PA complaint against GMRS (2.1); revise PA motion for class cert (1.6)	430.00	3.7	1,591.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/17/15] Steven Woodrow: Further research re: application of PA state law claims for potential incorporation into PA case	430.00	1.4	602.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Further edits and revisions to Motion for Class Cert (.8); and edit draft Thompson complaint (.6)	430.00	1.4	602.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Coordination with local counsel in PA re: Thompson filing	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/22/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ Local Counsel re: Zilveti case and filing of Thompson case	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow and S Coleman on PA Statute	330.00	0.5	165.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/23/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research on applicability of PA telemarketing statute to this case - conclude doesn't apply to political calls	330.00	1.5	495.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Research PA state statute re: autodialed calls and political calling to determine applicability of PA state law claims to new PA GMRS lawsuit	430.00	2.2	946.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Email to local counsel re: Thompson case	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/23/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Coleman re: PA claims	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Coordination w/ local counsel re: filing of Thompson complaint and other initial case documents: (.8); review engagement letter w/ local counsel (.3)	430.00	1.1	473.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/24/15] Steven Woodrow: Final "once over" review of all pleadings prior to filing Thompson lawsuit	430.00	0.4	172.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with local counsel (B Cohen) re courtesy copies	330.00	0.2	66.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/29/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge Brody's practice standards	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 06/29/15] Steven Woodrow: Finalize PHV application	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Communications with process server re service on GMRS	330.00	0.5	165.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Call w/ Court re: re-setting the CMC	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/27/15] Steven Woodrow: Prepare FAX request for resetting of CMC and letter	430.00	0.6	258.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/28/15] Patrick Peluso: reviewing communications including S Woodrow and S Schwartz regarding rescheduling 8/3 conference	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/28/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing draft fax to court regarding rescheduling conference	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/28/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ S.Schwartz re: FAX to court	430.00	0.3	129.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing communication with S Woodrow and S Schwartz regarding rescheduling conference	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/31/15] Patrick Peluso: Initial review of GMRS's motion to dismiss or transfer	330.00	1.2	396.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf w/ S.Schwartz's office re: resetting of hearing	430.00	0.2	86.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 07/31/15] Steven Woodrow: Legal research re: requirement of filing safe-harbor letter prior to moving for sanctions	430.00	1.7	731.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/01/15] Patrick Peluso: Further review - GMRS's motion to dismiss/transfer	330.00	0.3	99.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/03/15] Patrick Peluso: Legal research re GMRS's motion to dismiss or transfer	330.00	2.5	825.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/04/15] Patrick Peluso: Further legal research - GMRS Motion	330.00	1.1	363.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Communications with S Woodrow and S Schwartz re Thompson deposition proposal	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/10/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting opposition to GMRS MTD/transfer	330.00	2.7	891.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/12/15] Patrick Peluso: GMRS motion to dismiss/transfer - case law research	330.00	1.5	495.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/13/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting opposition to GMRS MTD/transfer	330.00	8.8	2,904.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/13/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit draft opposition to Motion to Transfer	430.00	2.7	1,161.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Woodrow edits to my draft opposition	330.00	1.2	396.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Beefing up "first to file" section of opposition brief	330.00	1.5	495.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Additional research re first to file rule	330.00	0.6	198.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing additional S Woodrow edits	330.00	0.5	165.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/14/15] Patrick Peluso: Doing table of authorities/contents - GMRS opposition brief	330.00	1	330.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting notice of supplemental authority re Martin case's denial of GMRS's motion to vacate	330.00	0.7	231.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/19/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing S Woodrow edits to notice of supp authority	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit Notice of Supplemental Authority for filing in Thompson (Martin Court's denial of GMRS motion for sanctions/reconsideration)	430.00	0.7	301.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/19/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. w/ P.Peluso re: meet and confer requirements	430.00	0.1	43.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Meetings	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Drafting supplement authority notice	330.00	0.75	247.50
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 08/20/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit draft Notice of Supplemental authority	430.00	0.4	172.00
Discovery	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/10/15] Steven Woodrow: Draft proposed CMC statement	430.00	1	430.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conference with S Woodrow re hearing on mot to transfer	330.00	1	330.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Hearing on CMC and motion to transfer	330.00	1	330.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow re Joint Report	330.00	0.2	66.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing joint report before filing (.2) and filing (.1)	330.00	0.3	99.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing communications involving S Woodrow and S Schwartz re joint discovery plan	330.00	0.5	165.00
Discovery	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Email exchange w/ opposing counsel re: joint CMC statement	430.00	0.8	344.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/11/15] Steven Woodrow: Review and edit draft CMC report	430.00	0.9	387.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Appear by Telephone at CMC and argument on motion to transfer	430.00	1	430.00
Hearings and other Court Appearances	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Prep for hearing on CMC and Motion to Transfer: review filings (.5); review CMC statement and research re: judge and standing orders (.8)	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/16/15] Steven Woodrow: Email Schwartz re: agreement to proposed case schedule	430.00	0.1	43.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 09/18/15] Steven Woodrow: Conf. re: local counsel w/ P.Peluso	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 10/15/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing and editing draft notice of supp authority	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 10/15/15] Steven Woodrow: Edit and approve notice of supplemental authority	430.00	0.4	172.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 11/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing United States' response brief	330.00	1.5	495.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 11/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing United States' notice	330.00	0.3	99.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 11/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Reviewing Judge's order on MTD/transfer	330.00	1	330.00

Task	Time Entry Notes	Rate	Hours	Line Total
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 11/20/15] Patrick Peluso: Conferral with S Woodrow re Judge's order on MTD/Transfer	330.00	0.4	132.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Conferral about asking for stay to be held off	330.00	0.75	247.50
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/20/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into how to request that a transfer be delayed	330.00	4.3	1,419.00
General	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/20/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and analyze Court's Order granting transfer of case to MD FL	430.00	1.2	516.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/22/16] Steven Woodrow: Strategy session w/ PPeluso re: impact of Thompson on settlement and settlement documents	430.00	1.3	559.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/25/16] Patrick Peluso: Review emails Woodrow to Blaker Schwartz about staying Thompson transfer	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/25/16] Steven Woodrow: Email to GMRS counsel re: staying transfer of Thompson case	430.00	0.2	86.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/26/16] Patrick Peluso: Review follow up email from Woodrow about staying Thompson transfer	330.00	0.2	66.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 01/28/16] Steven Woodrow: Further email re: staying of Thompson case	430.00	0.2	86.00
Pleadings, Motions, or other Writing	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 02/16/16] Patrick Peluso: Comparing Zilveti ORder to Thompson order	330.00	1.3	429.00
Research	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 02/16/16] Patrick Peluso: Legal research into whether there's a way to move to reconsider in Thompson still (since the Zilveti Court came out so differently on the same issue)	330.00	5.6	1,848.00
Communication	[Thompson v. GMRS (PA) 02/26/16] Steven Woodrow: Review and respond to Schwartz email re: consolidation of Thompson and Martin/Armstrong cases	430.00	0.2	86.00
Total				29,182.00
Amount Paid				0.00
Balance Due (USD)				\$29,182.00

PAYMENT STUB

Woodrow & Peluso, LLC
3900 E Mexico Ave
Suite 300
Denver CO
United States

Client	ppeluso@woodrowpeluso.com
Invoice #	0000061
Invoice Date	July 6, 2016
Balance Due (USD)	\$29,182.00
Amount Enclosed	